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Part 6. Accommodations for Individuals 
With Disabilities and Impairments (Read 
the information in the instructions before 
completing this section.)

I am requesting an accommodation:

1. Because of my disability(ies) and/or 
impairment(s).

 Yes   No

2. For my spouse because of his or her 
disability(ies) and/or impairment(s).

 Yes   No

3. For my included child(ren) because of his 
or her (their) disability(ies) and/or 
impairment(s).

 Yes   No

If you answered "Yes," check any applicable
box.  Provide information on the 
disability(ies) and/or impairment(s) for each 
person:

 Deaf or hard of hearing and request the 
following accommodation(s) (if requesting a
sign-language interpreter, indicate which 
language (e.g., American Sign Language)):  
___________________________________

 Blind or sight-impaired and request the 
following accommodation(s):
____________________________________

 Other type of disability(ies) and/or 
impairment(s) (describe the nature of the 
disability(ies) and/or impairment(s) and 
accommodation(s) being requested):
_________________________________
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