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March 28, 2011 

8:00 Welcome, Board Processes, and 
Participant Introductions 

8:20–10 Session I: The Vision of Data- 
Intensive Science 

10:15–12 Session II: Reproducibility, 
First Steps and Guiding Principles 

12:30 High Performance 
Cyberinfrastructure is Needed to 
Enable Data-Intensive Science and 
Engineering 

1–3 Session III: Exemplars, Lessons 
Learned 

3:15–5:30 Session IV: Impacts 

March 29, 2011 

8:30 National Science Foundation 
Perspective 

8:45–10:30 Session V: Policy Issues 
10:45–11 Public Comment Period 
11–12:30 Session IV: Policy Issues 

(continued) 
12:30 Adjourn 
STATUS: Open. 
LOCATION: This workshop/meeting will 
be held at the National Science 
Foundation, 4201 Wilson Blvd., Room 
1235, Arlington, VA 22230. All visitors 
must contact the Board Office [call 703– 
292–7000 or send an e-mail message to 
nationalsciencebrd@nsf.gov] at least 24 
hours prior to the teleconference and 
provide name and organizational 
affiliation. All visitors must report to the 
NSF visitor desk located in the lobby at 
the 9th and N. Stuart Streets entrance on 
the day of the teleconference to receive 
a visitor’s badge. 
UPDATES & POINT OF CONTACT: Please 
refer to the National Science Board Web 
site http://www.nsf.gov/nsb for 
additional information and schedule 
updates (time, place, subject matter or 
status of meeting) may be found at 
http://www.nsf.gov/nsb/notices/. Point 
of contact for this meeting is: Blane 
Dahl, National Science Board Office, 
4201 Wilson Blvd., Arlington, VA 
22230. Telephone: (703) 292–7000. 

Daniel A. Lauretano, 
Counsel to the National Science Board. 
[FR Doc. 2011–6637 Filed 3–17–11; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 7555–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards (ACRS); Meeting of the 
ACRS Subcommittee on Planning and 
Procedures; Notice of Meeting 

The ACRS Subcommittee on Planning 
and Procedures will hold a meeting on 
April 6, 2011, Room T–2B3, 11545 
Rockville Pike, Rockville, Maryland. 

The entire meeting will be open to 
public attendance, with the exception of 
a portion that may be closed pursuant 
to 5 U.S.C. 552b(c)(2) and (6) to discuss 
organizational and personnel matters 
that relate solely to the internal 
personnel rules and practices of the 
ACRS, and information the release of 
which would constitute a clearly 
unwarranted invasion of personal 
privacy. 

The agenda for the subject meeting 
shall be as follows: 

Wednesday, April 6, 2011—12 p.m. 
until 1 p.m. 

The Subcommittee will discuss 
proposed ACRS activities and related 
matters. The Subcommittee will gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the Full Committee. 
Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official (DFO), Kent Howard 
(Telephone 301–415–2989 or e-mail: 
Kent.Howard@nrc.gov) five days prior to 
the meeting, if possible, so that 
appropriate arrangements can be made. 
Thirty-five hard copies of each 
presentation or handout should be 
provided to the DFO thirty minutes 
before the meeting. In addition, one 
electronic copy of each presentation 
should be e-mailed to the DFO one day 
before the meeting. If an electronic copy 
cannot be provided within this 
timeframe, presenters should provide 
the DFO with a CD containing each 
presentation at least thirty minutes 
before the meeting. Electronic 
recordings will be permitted only 
during those portions of the meeting 
that are open to the public. Detailed 
procedures for the conduct of and 
participation in ACRS meetings were 
published in the Federal Register on 
October 21, 2010 (75 FR 65038–65039). 

Detailed meeting agendas and meeting 
transcripts are available on the NRC 
Web site at http://www.nrc.gov/reading- 
rm/doc-collections/acrs. Information 
regarding topics to be discussed, 
changes to the agenda, whether the 
meeting has been canceled or 
rescheduled, and the time allotted to 
present oral statements can be obtained 
from the Web site cited above or by 
contacting the identified DFO. 
Moreover, in view of the possibility that 
the schedule for ACRS meetings may be 
adjusted by the Chairman as necessary 
to facilitate the conduct of the meeting, 
persons planning to attend should check 
with these references if such 
rescheduling would result in a major 
inconvenience. 

Dated: March 15, 2011. 
Cayetano Santos, 
Chief, Reactor Safety Branch A, Advisory 
Committee on Reactor Safeguards. 
[FR Doc. 2011–6527 Filed 3–18–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

OFFICE OF PERSONNEL 
MANAGEMENT 

Submission for Review: 
Representative Payee Survey, RI 
38–115 

AGENCY: U.S. Office of Personnel 
Management. 
ACTION: 60-Day Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Retirement Services, 
Office of Personnel Management (OPM) 
offers the general public and other 
Federal agencies the opportunity to 
comment on an existing information 
collection request (ICR) 3206–0208, 
Representative Payee Survey. As 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995 (Pub. L. 104–13, 44 U.S.C. 
chapter 35) as amended by the Clinger- 
Cohen Act (Pub. L. 104–106), OPM is 
soliciting comments for this collection. 
The Office of Management and Budget 
is particularly interested in comments 
that: 

1. Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of functions 
of the agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

2. Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

3. Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

4. Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submissions 
of responses. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted until May 20, 2011. 
This process is conducted in accordance 
with 5 CFR 1320.1. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments on 
the proposed information collection to 
U.S. Office of Personnel Management, 
Linda Bradford (Acting), Deputy 
Associate Director, Retirement 
Operations, Retirement Services, 1900 E 
Street, NW., Room 3305, Washington, 
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DC 20415–3500 or send via electronic 
mail to Martha.Moore@opm.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: A 
copy of this ICR, with applicable 
supporting documentation, may be 
obtained by contacting the Publications 
Team, Office of Personnel Management, 
1900 E Street, NW., Room 4332, 
Washington, DC 20415, Attention: Cyrus 
S. Benson, or sent via electronic mail to 
Cyrus.Benson@opm.gov or faxed to 
(202) 606–0910. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Representative Payee Survey is used to 
collect information about how the 
benefits paid to a representative payee 
have been used or conserved for the 
benefit of the incompetent annuitant. 

Analysis: 
Agency: Retirement Operations, 

Retirement Services, Office of Personnel 
Management. 

Title: Representative Payee Survey. 
OMB Number: 3206–0208. 
Frequency: Annually. 
Affected Public: Individuals or 

Households. 
Number of Respondents: 11,000. 
Estimated Time per Respondent: 20 

minutes. 
Total Burden Hours: 3,667. 
U.S. Office of Personnel Management. 

John Berry, 
Director. 
[FR Doc. 2011–6574 Filed 3–18–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6325–38–P 

RAILROAD RETIREMENT BOARD 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

Summary: In accordance with the 
requirement of Section 3506(c)(2)(A) of 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
which provides opportunity for public 
comment on new or revised data 
collections, the Railroad Retirement 
Board (RRB) will publish periodic 
summaries of proposed data collections. 

Comments are invited on: (a) Whether 
the proposed information collection is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the agency, including 
whether the information has practical 
utility; (b) the accuracy of the RRB’s 
estimate of the burden of the collection 
of the information; (c) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
ways to minimize the burden related to 
the collection of information on 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Title and purpose of information 
collection: 

Request for Internet Services, OMB 
3220–0198. 

The RRB uses a Personal 
Identification Number (PIN)/Password 
system that allows RRB customers to 
conduct business with the agency 
electronically. As part of the system, the 
RRB collects information needed to 
establish a unique PIN/Password that 
allows customer access to RRB Internet- 
based services. The information 
collected is matched against records of 
the railroad employee that are 
maintained by the RRB. If the 
information is verified, the request is 
approved and the RRB mails a Password 
Request Code (PRC) to the requestor. If 
the information provided cannot be 
verified, the requestor is advised to 
contact the nearest field office of the 
RRB to resolve the discrepancy. Once a 
PRC is obtained from the RRB, the 
requestor can apply for a PIN/Password 
online. Once the PIN/Password has been 
established, the requestor has access to 
RRB Internet-based services. The RRB 
estimates that approximately 9,613 
requests for PRC’s and PIN/Passwords 
are received annually and that it takes 
5 minutes per response to secure a PRC 
and 1.5 minutes to establish a PIN/ 
Password. Completion is voluntary, 
however, the RRB will be unable to 
provide a PRC or allow a requestor to 
establish a PIN/Password (thereby 
denying system access), if the requests 
are not completed. The RRB proposes 
no changes to the PRC and PIN/ 
Password screens. 

Additional Information or Comments: 
To request more information or to 
obtain a copy of the information 
collection justification, forms, and/or 
supporting material, please call the RRB 
Clearance Officer at (312) 751–3363 or 
send an e-mail request to 
Charles.Mierzwa@RRB.gov. Comments 
regarding the information collection 
should be sent to Patricia A. Henaghan, 
Railroad Retirement Board, 844 N. Rush 
Street, Chicago, Illinois 60611–2092 or 
Patricia.Henaghan@RRR.GOV. 
Comments should be received within 60 
days of this notice. 

Charles Mierzwa, 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2011–6516 Filed 3–18–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7905–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

Upon Written Request, Copies Available 
From: U.S. Securities and Exchange 

Commission, Office of Investor 
Education and Advocacy, 
Washington, DC 20549–0213. 

Extension: 
Rule 19b–4 and Form 19b–4, OMB 

Control No. 3235–0045, SEC File 
No. 270–38. 

Notice is hereby given that pursuant 
to the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(44 U.S.C. 3501 et seq.), the Securities 
and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’) is soliciting comments 
on the collection of information 
summarized below. The Commission 
plans to submit this existing collection 
of information to the Office of 
Management and Budget for extension 
and approval. 

• Rule 19b–4 (17 CFR 240.19b–4) and 
Form 19b–4—Filings with respect to 
proposed rule changes by self-regulatory 
organizations. 

Section 19(b) of the Securities 
Exchange Act of 1934 (‘‘Act’’) (15 U.S.C. 
78s(b)) requires each self-regulatory 
organization (‘‘SRO’’) to file with the 
Commission copies of any proposed 
rule, or any proposed change in, 
addition to, or deletion from the rules of 
such SRO. Rule 19b–4 (17 CFR 240.19b– 
4) implements the requirements of 
Section 19(b) by requiring the SROs to 
file their proposed rule changes on 
Form 19b–4 and by clarifying which 
actions taken by SROs are deemed 
proposed rule changes and so must be 
filed pursuant to Section 19(b). 

The collection of information is 
designed to provide the Commission 
with the information necessary to 
determine, as required by the Act, 
whether the proposed rule change is 
consistent with the Act and the rules 
thereunder. The information is used to 
determine if the proposed rule change 
should be approved, disapproved, or if 
proceedings should be instituted to 
determine whether the proposed rule 
change should be approved or 
disapproved. 

The respondents to the collection of 
information are self-regulatory 
organizations (as defined by the Act), 
including national securities exchanges, 
national securities associations, 
registered clearing agencies and the 
Municipal Securities Rulemaking Board. 

Twenty-three respondents file an 
average total of 1,323 responses per 
year. Each response takes approximately 
23.51 hours to complete. Thus, the 
estimated annual response burden is 
31,105 hours. At an average cost per 
response of $6,945.64, the resultant total 
related cost of compliance for these 
respondents is $9,191,396.21 per year 
(1,323 responses × $6,945.64/response = 
$9,191,396.21). 
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