SEPA United States Environmental Protec	tion
Agency	uon

## **United States Environmental Protection Agency** Washington D.C. 20460

	Agen		illowi	11000	COOII							••	as		ıgı	OII	<u>, L</u>	·. <b>U</b> .		<u> </u>	00										
Request for Pesticide Applicator Certification in Indian Country																															
	LAST	LAST NAME (+ Jr, Sr, II, III etc.) FIRST NAME																МІ													
	MAIL	ING	ADI	DRES	SS									<u> </u>									1								1
	CITY			<u> </u>				<u> </u>				<u> </u>		l J				STAT	TF		ZIP			<u> </u>	<u> </u>						ı
																		017													1
	AREA CODE TELEPHONE COUNTY OFFICE USE															ı															
	AREA	100	DE		,		ICLE	FIIC	)NE							500	INII										OFF	ICE	USE		ĺ
	(				)					_																					l
EMAIL ADDRESS (optional)																															
																							ļ								
	2 DI	)TII	D 4 7										2		VED.	ΛΙ ΛΙ	ו וחכ	CATO	ים ו	D # /	':f =0.		.1\.								
	2. BIF	XIП	DA	I E.	М	М	_	D	D	_	Υ	Υ	3	. FEC	)EK/	AL AI	PLI	CATC	ואל	U# (	,ii rei	iewa	II <i>)</i> .								
	4. CERTIFICATION TYPE: Initial Certificate Renewal/Recertification Replacement (Lost Card)																														
	5. AP	PLIC	CAT	OR T	YPE	-			С	omme	ercia	l App	licat	or			Priva	ate Ap	plica	ator											
	6. CE	RTIF	FICA	ATIOI	N ME	THO	DD:																								
	a.	Γ	_ ,	Reau	estin	na fec	deral	certif	ficate	e base	ed o	n vali	d fed	deral,	state	e or t	ribal	certifi	cate	or li	cens	e. (A	ttacl	n a co	o vac	f cert	ificat	te.)			
	State	) (if o												,								(-			,,			,			
	State (if applicable): Applicator Number:																														
Expiration Date:																															
	Applicator Category/Categories for which Certificate/License was Received (enter category code(s)):																														
b. Training and self-evaluation (ONLY for private applicators who do not hold a certification)																															
	By signing this application below and submitting to U.S. EPA, I hereby attest to the fact that:  1. I have physically attended an EPA-approved training course and personally completed the self-study evaluation.																														
	<ol> <li>I nave physically attended an EPA-approved training course and personally completed the self-study evaluation.</li> <li>I understand and can apply the information therein.</li> </ol>																														
	<ol> <li>I understand the significance of labeling and understand my legal responsibilities for the use of pesticides in accordance with label instructions and warnings;</li> </ol>														ıgs;																
			4				•						•	icides (	•	•			•				•		•			•	•	•	r
					nploye		o othe	r prop	erty i	the a	pplica	tion is	made	e witho	ut co	mpen	sation	other	than t	radin	g of p	erson	al ser	vices i	oetwee	en pro	ducei	's of a	griculti	ural	
	7. P	LEA	SE	SIG	N H	ERE	-																								
	I atte									ende	d or	revol	ked ii	n the I	last 4	4 yea	ırs by	y any	state	e, trib	oe, o	r terr	itory	. If it	has I	been	, plea	ase			
	A fals	se st	aten	nent	in thi	s cer	tifica	tion r	may					ial of																	
	`		,		,			,		,				ments od fait		t I ha	ve m	ade c	n th	is foi	m aı	e tru	e, c	omple	ete ar	nd co	rrect				
	SIGI			•		. 3			, -				J	- "-						DA	TE :	SIGI	NEC	):							
	(FOF			_	E:)																			_							
	REC:							AP	P:							INI <sup>°</sup>	Т:							SE	NT:						

## INSTRUCTIONS FOR COMPLETING EPA FORM xxxx-xx-x PAPERWORK REDUCTION ACT NOTICE

This form is to be used to request certification to purchase and apply Restricted Use Pesticides in Indian Country from the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency.

- 1. Fill out all of the information. An email address is requested but is not required. Phone number listed should be one at which you can be reached during business hours.
- 2. Enter your birth date using the numerical month-month-date-date-year-year format.
- 3. Enter your EPA Federal Applicator Identification number if this is a renewal or request for a replacement card.
- 4. Certificate Type: Check appropriate box. If this is your first application for a pesticide applicator certification in Indian Country, check "Initial Certificate".
- 5. Applicator Type: Check "Private Applicator" ONLY if you will be or are <u>applying pesticides for production of an agricultural commodity on property owned or rented by you or your employer</u>. All other applicators check "Commercial Applicator". There is no "noncommercial" or "public" federal applicator type.
- 6. Certification Method: In most cases you will check "Requesting federal certificate based on valid federal, state or tribal certificate or license".
- 6a. Enter the two character state for which you hold a valid certificate/license, if applicable, the applicator number for your existing certificate, and expiration date. Enter the code for the category or categories for which you are currently certified/licensed. Attach a photocopy of both sides of your federal, state or tribal certification or license.
- 6b. If you do not hold a valid federal, state or tribal applicator certificate and you are a private applicator, you may be certified after physically attending and completing an EPA-approved training course and completing the self-study evaluation. **Include documentation of completion of the required training course(s) and attach the completed self-study evaluation.**
- 7. Sign and date the application and mail the application with a photocopy of both sides of your existing federal, state, or tribal pesticide applicator certificate/license (if you are requesting certification based on a federal, state, or tribal certification) to:

[Need addresses for each Region]

**Paperwork Reduction Act Notice:** The public reporting burden for respondents completing this form is estimated to average about 10 minutes per response. Send comments (referencing OMB Control Number 2070-0029 and EPA Form 2070-xx-x) about the burden estimate or any other aspect of this collection of information, including suggestions for reducing the burden to: Director, Collection Strategies Division (2822T), U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave., N.W., Washington, D.C. 20460. Do not send your completed application form to this address.