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B. COLLECTIONS OF INFORMATION EMPLOYING STATISTICAL 
METHODS

This collection of information does not employ statistical methods.  

B.1 Describe the potential respondent universe and any sampling or other 
respondent selection to be used.

The respondents are manufacturers of motor vehicles or motor vehicle 
equipment, other than tires, to which a Federal motor vehicle safety standard 
(FMVSS) applies.  All such manufacturers must identify themselves to 
NHTSA no later than 30 days after they begin to manufacture a vehicle or 
equipment item subject to the FMVSS.  Since the reporting requirement has 
such universal application, there is no need to employ sampling or other 
methods to select respondents.   

B.2 Describe the procedures for the collection of information.

The information is collected through submissions to the agency’s website at 
https://vpic.nhtsa.dot.gov.  

B.3 Describe methods to maximize response rates.

If a manufacturer fails to properly identify itself or its products to NHTSA, the
agency can bar the importation of the manufacturer’s products.  In addition, 
some State Departments of Motor Vehicles will consult the list of 
manufacturers that have registered with NHTSA on the agency’s website at 
https://vpic.nhtsa.dot.gov and deny registration to the owner of a vehicle 
produced by a company that has failed to register.  Likewise, Canada will not 
permit the importation of vehicles originating in the United States unless the 
manufacturer has registered with NHTSA.

B.4 Describe any tests of procedures or methods to be undertaken.

No procedures or methods will be undertaken as part of the information 
collection.  As a consequence, no tests of such procedures or methods are 
planned.

B.5 Provide the name and telephone number of individuals consulted on statistical
aspects of the design.

Because this collection of information does not employ statistical methods,  
no one has been consulted on these.
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