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6. Biometrics.  You may be required, if you are
13 1/2 years of age or older to provide 
fingerprints, photograph, and/or additional 
signature to verify your identity, obtain 
additional information, and conduct background
and security checks, including a check of 
criminal history records.  You will be informed 
when and where you need to attend a biometric 
services appointment.  If you fail to attend your 
biometric services appointment, USCIS may 
reject, close, or deny your form.
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6. Biometrics.  You may be required, to 
provide fingerprints, photograph, and/or 
additional signature to verify your identity, 
obtain additional information, and conduct 
background and security checks, including a 
check of criminal history records.  You will be 
informed when and where you will need to 
provide these biometrics.  If you fail to provide 
these biometrics as requested, USCIS may 
reject, close, or deny your form.
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