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findings and the letter to the borrower 
announcing the loan. 

(b) If the loan is not approved, RUS 
shall notify the borrower, in writing, of 
the reasons. 

§ 1737.92 Loan documents. 
Following approval of the loan, RUS 

shall forward the necessary loan docu-
ments to the borrower for execution, 
delivery, recording, and filing, as di-
rected by RUS. See 7 CFR part 1758 for 
details (or RUS Bulletins 320–4, 320–22, 
321–2, 322–2, 323–1, or 326–1). 

§§ 1737.93–1737.99 [Reserved] 

Subpart K—Release of Funds 
Procedure 

§ 1737.100 Prerequisites to the release 
and advance of funds. 

(a) Standard prerequisites to the ad-
vance of funds, generally applied to all 
loans, are set forth in Article II of the 
form of loan contract attached as ap-
pendix A to 7 CFR part 1758. Additional 
prerequisites may be added on a case 
by case basis to the loan contract. 

(b) Before any loan funds can be ad-
vanced, RUS must approve a release of 
funds. 

(c) RUS approves the release of funds 
only after it determines that all pre-
requisites to the advance of loan funds 
have been met or funds should be ad-
vanced even though certain loan con-
tract prerequisites remain unsatisfied. 

(d) Following release approval, loan 
funds and related nonloan funds may 
be advanced in accordance with 7 CFR 
part 1744. 

(e) The borrower may be required to 
discharge indebtedness and/or to close 
acquisitions before advances are made 
for construction purposes. In such 
cases, the borrower shall submit evi-
dence that these actions have been 
completed. If the evidence is satisfac-
tory to RUS, RUS shall allow the re-
maining loan funds to be advanced in 
accordance with 7 CFR part 1744. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 0572–0085) 

§ 1737.101 Amounts spent for preloan 
activities. 

If the borrower desires to credit 
amounts spent for preloan activities 

against any equity or general funds re-
quired by the loan contract, it shall 
submit an itemized statement of such 
expenditures to the Area Office. These 
expenditures will be accounted for on 
RUS Form 503, ‘‘Release of Telephone 
Loan Funds,’’ if RUS determines that 
the amounts spent are reasonable 
based on normal industry practice and 
that the procedures set forth in 7 CFR 
part 1737, subpart D, have been com-
plied with. Statements of preloan ex-
penditures will be verified as to accu-
racy by loan fund audits. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 0572–0085) 

§§ 1737.102–1737.109 [Reserved] 

PART 1738—RURAL BROADBAND 
ACCESS LOANS AND LOAN 
GUARANTEES 

Subpart A—General 

1738.1 Overview. 
1738.2 Definitions. 
1738.3 Substantially underserved trust 

areas. 
1738.4–1738.50 [Reserved] 

Subpart B—Eligible and Ineligible Loan 
Purposes 

1738.51 Eligible loan purposes. 
1738.52 Ineligible loan purposes. 
1738.53–1738.100 [Reserved] 

Subpart C—Eligibility Requirements 

1738.101 Eligible applicants. 
1738.102 Eligible service area. 
1738.103 Eligible service area exceptions for 

broadband facility upgrades. 
1738.104 Preliminary assessment of service 

area eligibility. 
1738.105–1738.150 [Reserved] 

Subpart D—Direct Loan Terms 

1738.151 General. 
1738.152 Interest rates. 
1738.153 Loan terms and conditions. 
1738.154 Loan security. 
1738.155 Special terms and conditions. 
1738.156 Other Federal requirements. 
1738.157–1738.200 [Reserved] 

Subpart E—Application Review and 
Underwriting 

1738.201 Application submission. 
1738.202 Elements of a complete application. 
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1738.203 Priority for processing loan appli-
cations. 

1738.204 Public notice. 
1738.205 Notification of completeness. 
1738.206 Evaluation for feasibility. 
1738.207 Equity requirement. 
1738.208 Additional cash requirements. 
1738.209 Market survey. 
1738.210 Competitive analysis. 
1738.211 Financial information. 
1738.212 Network design. 
1738.213 Loan determination. 
1738.214–1738.250 [Reserved] 

Subpart F—Closing, Servicing, and 
Reporting 

1738.251 Loan offer and loan closing. 
1738.252 Construction. 
1738.253 Servicing. 
1738.254 Accounting, reporting, and moni-

toring requirements. 
1738.255 Default and de-obligation. 
1738.256–1738.300 [Reserved] 

Subpart G—Loan Guarantee 

1738.301 General. 
1738.302 Eligible guaranteed lenders. 
1738.303 Requirements for the loan guar-

antee. 
1738.304 Terms for guarantee. 
1738.305 Obligations of guaranteed lender. 
1738.306 Agency rights and remedies. 
1738.307 Additional policies. 
1738.308 Full faith and credit of the United 

States. 
1738.309–1738.349 [Reserved] 
1738.350 OMB control number. 

AUTHORITY: 7 U.S.C. 901 et seq. 

SOURCE: 80 FR 45402, July 30, 2015, unless 
otherwise noted. 

Subpart A—General 

§ 1738.1 Overview. 
(a) The Rural Broadband Access Loan 

and Loan Guarantee Program furnishes 
loans and loan guarantees for the costs 
of construction, improvement, or ac-
quisition of facilities and equipment 
needed to provide service at the 
broadband lending speed in eligible 
rural areas. This part sets forth the 
general policies, eligibility require-
ments, types and terms of loans and 
loan guarantees, and program require-
ments under 7 U.S.C. 901 et seq. 

(b) Additional information and appli-
cation materials regarding the Rural 
Broadband Access Loan and Loan 
Guarantee Program can be found on 
the Rural Development Web site. 

§ 1738.2 Definitions. 
(a) The following definitions apply to 

part 1738: 
Acquisition means the purchase of as-

sets by acquiring facilities, equipment, 
operations, licenses, or majority stock 
interest of one or more organizations. 
Stock acquisitions must be arm’s- 
length transactions. 

Administrator means the Adminis-
trator of the Rural Utilities Service 
(RUS), or the Administrator’s designee. 

Advance means the transfer of loan 
funds from the Agency to the borrower. 

Affiliate or affiliated company of any 
specified person or entity means any 
other person or entity directly or indi-
rectly controlling of, controlled by, 
under direct or indirect common con-
trol with, or related to, such specified 
entity, or which exists for the sole pur-
pose of providing any service to one 
company or exclusively to companies 
which otherwise meet the definition of 
affiliate. This definition includes Vari-
able Interest Entities as described in 
Financial Accounting Standards Board 
Interpretation (FIN) No. 46(R), Consoli-
dation of Variable Interest Entities. For 
the purpose of this definition, ‘‘con-
trol’’ means the possession directly or 
indirectly, of the power to direct or 
cause the direction of the management 
and policies of a company, whether 
such power is exercised through one or 
more intermediary companies, or 
alone, or in conjunction with or pursu-
ant to an agreement with, one or more 
other companies, and whether such 
power is established through a major-
ity or minority ownership voting of se-
curities, common directors, officers, or 
stockholders, voting trust, or holding 
trusts (other than money exchanged) 
for property or services. 

Agency means the Rural Utilities 
Service, which administers the United 
States Department of Agriculture’s 
(USDA’s) Rural Development Utilities 
Programs, including the Rural 
Broadband Access Loan and Loan 
Guarantee Program. 

Applicant means an entity requesting 
approval of a loan or loan guarantee 
under this part. 

Arm’s-length transaction means a 
transaction between two related or af-
filiated parties that is conducted as if 
they were unrelated, so that there is no 
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question of conflict of interest, or a 
transaction between two otherwise un-
related or unaffiliated parties. 

Borrower means any organization 
that has an outstanding broadband or 
telecommunications loan made or 
guaranteed by the Agency. 

Broadband borrower means any orga-
nization that has an outstanding 
broadband loan made or guaranteed by 
the Agency. 

Broadband grant means a Community 
Connect or Broadband Initiatives Pro-
gram grant approved by the Agency. 

Broadband lending speed means the 
minimum bandwidth requirement, as 
published by the Agency in its latest 
notice in the FEDERAL REGISTER that 
an applicant must propose to deliver to 
every customer in the proposed funded 
service area in order for the Agency to 
approve a broadband loan and may be 
different for fixed and mobile 
broadband service. Broadband lending 
speed may be faster than the minimum 
transmission capacity required to de-
termine the availability of broadband 
service when qualifying a service area. 
If a new broadband lending speed is 
published in the FEDERAL REGISTER 
while an application is pending, the 
pending application will be processed 
based on the broadband lending speed 
that was in effect when the application 
was submitted. 

Broadband loan means any loan ap-
proved under Title VI of the Rural 
Electrification Act of 1936, as amended 
(RE Act). 

Broadband service means any tech-
nology identified by the Administrator 
as having the capacity to provide 
transmission facilities that enable the 
subscriber to receive a minimum level 
of service equal to at least a down-
stream transmission capacity of 4 
megabits per second (Mbps) and an up-
stream transmission capacity of 1 
Mbps. The Agency will publish the 
minimum transmission capacity that 
will qualify as broadband service in a 
notice in the FEDERAL REGISTER and 
this rate may be different for fixed and 
mobile broadband service. The min-
imum transmission capacity may be 
higher than 4 Mbps downstream and 1 
Mbps upstream but cannot be lower. 
The minimum transmission capacity 
that defines broadband service may be 

different than the broadband lending 
speed. If a new minimum transmission 
capacity is published in the FEDERAL 
REGISTER while an application is pend-
ing, broadband service for the purpose 
of reviewing the application will be de-
fined by the minimum transmission ca-
pacity that was required at the time 
the application was received by the 
Agency. 

Build-out means the construction, 
improvement, or acquisition of facili-
ties and equipment. 

Competitive analysis means a study 
that identifies service providers and 
products in the service area that will 
compete with the applicant’s oper-
ations. 

Composite economic life means the 
weighted (by dollar amount of each 
class of facility in the loan) average 
economic life as determined by the 
Agency of all classes of facilities fi-
nanced by the loan. 

Cost share means equity, as defined 
by generally accepted accounting prin-
ciples (GAAP). 

Customer premises equipment (CPE), in 
the context of network services, means 
any network-related equipment used 
by a customer to connect to a service 
provider’s network. 

Economic life means the estimated 
useful service life of an asset financed 
by the loan, as determined by the 
Agency. 

Equity means total assets minus total 
liabilities, as determined by GAAP and 
as classified according to the Agency’s 
system of accounts, and as used in this 
Part for purposes of section 306F of the 
RE Act (7 U.S.C. 936f) includes the re-
quirements of credit support and cost 
share in Title VI of the RE Act. 

Feasibility study means the evaluation 
of the pro forma financial analysis pre-
pared by the Agency, based on the fi-
nancial projections supplied by the ap-
plicant and as found acceptable by the 
Agency, to determine the financial fea-
sibility of a loan request. 

Financial feasibility means the appli-
cant’s ability to generate sufficient 
revenues to cover its expenses, suffi-
cient cash flow to service its debts and 
obligations as they come due, and meet 
the minimum Times Interest Earned 
Ratio (TIER) requirement of 1.25 (see 
§ 1738.211(b)(2)(ii)) by the end of the 
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forecast period, as evaluated by the 
Agency. Financial feasibility of a loan 
application is based on five-year pro-
jections, and will be based on the en-
tire operation of the applicant and not 
limited to the funded project. 

Fiscal year refers to the applicant or 
borrower’s fiscal year, unless otherwise 
indicated. 

Forecast period means the time period 
used in the feasibility study to deter-
mine if an application is financially 
feasible. 

GAAP means generally accepted ac-
counting principles. 

Grantee means any organization that 
has an outstanding broadband grant 
made by the Agency, with outstanding 
obligations under the grant. 

Guaranteed loan amount means the 
amount of the loan which is guaran-
teed by the Agency. 

Guaranteed loan note means, collec-
tively, the note or notes executed and 
delivered by the borrower to evidence 
the guaranteed loan. 

Guaranteed loan portion means any 
portion of the guaranteed loan. 

Guaranteed loan portion amount means 
that amount of payment on account of 
any guaranteed loan portion which is 
guaranteed under the terms of the 
guarantee. 

Guaranteed loan portion note means 
any note executed and delivered by the 
borrower to evidence a guaranteed loan 
portion. 

Incumbent service provider means a 
service provider that: Offers terrestrial 
broadband service in the proposed fund-
ed service area and has not less than 
five percent of the households in an ap-
plicant’s proposed funded service area 
subscribing to their broadband service 
at the time of application submission. 
Resellers are not considered incumbent 
service providers. If an applicant pro-
poses an acquisition, the applicant will 
be considered a service provider for 
that area. 

Indefeasible right to use agreement 
(IRU) means the effective long-term 
lease of the capacity, or a portion 
thereof, of a cable, specified in terms of 
a certain amount of bandwidth or a 
certain number of dark fibers. 

Interim financing means funds used 
for eligible loan purposes after a loan 
offer has been extended to the appli-

cant by the Agency. Such funds may be 
eligible for reimbursement from loan 
funds if a loan is made. 

Loan means any loan made or guar-
anteed under this part by the Agency, 
unless otherwise noted. 

Loan contract means the loan agree-
ment between the Agency and the bor-
rower, including all amendments there-
to. 

Loan documents mean the loan agree-
ment, note(s), and security instru-
ment(s) between the borrower and the 
Agency and any associated documents 
pertaining to the broadband loan. 

Loan guarantee means a guarantee of 
a loan, or a portion of a loan, made by 
another lender 

Loan guarantee documents means the 
guarantee agreement between RUS and 
the lender, the loan and security agree-
ment(s) between the guaranteed lender 
and the borrower, the loan note guar-
antee made by RUS, the guaranteed 
loan note, and other security docu-
ments. 

Loan funds means funds provided pur-
suant to a broadband loan made or 
guaranteed under this part by the 
Agency. 

Market survey means the collection of 
information on the supply, demand, 
usage, and rates for proposed services 
to be offered by an applicant within 
each service area. It supports the appli-
cant’s financial projections. 

Pre-loan expense means any expense 
associated with the preparation of a 
loan application. Pre-loan expenses 
may be reimbursed with loan funds, as 
approved by RUS. 

Proposed Funded Service Area means 
the geographic service territory within 
which the applicant is proposing to 
offer service at the broadband lending 
speed. 

RE Act means the Rural Electrifica-
tion Act of 1936, as amended (7 U.S.C. 
901 et seq.). 

Reject means that the Agency returns 
the application to the applicant and 
discontinues processing of the loan ap-
plication because the application failed 
to meet the requirements of this part. 

Reseller means, in the context of net-
work services, a company that pur-
chases network services from network 
service providers in bulk and resells 
them to commercial businesses and 
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residential households. Resellers are 
not considered incumbent service pro-
viders. 

Rural area(s) means any area, as con-
firmed by the latest decennial census 
of the Bureau of the Census, which is 
not located within: 

(i) A city, town, or incorporated area 
that has a population of greater than 
20,000 inhabitants; or 

(ii) An urbanized area contiguous and 
adjacent to a city or town that has a 
population of greater than 50,000 inhab-
itants. For purposes of the definition of 
rural area, an urbanized area means a 
densely populated territory as defined 
in the latest decennial census of the 
U.S. Census Bureau. 

Security documents means any mort-
gage, deed of trust, security agree-
ment, financing statement, or other 
document which grants to the Agency 
or perfects a security interest, includ-
ing any amendments and supplements 
thereto. 

Service area means the geographic 
area within which a service provider of-
fers telecommunications service. 

Service provider means an entity pro-
viding telecommunications service. 

Service territory means ‘‘service area.’’ 
Start-up means a new business ven-

ture without operations or service de-
livery available. 

System of accounts means the Agen-
cy’s system of accounts for maintain-
ing financial records as described in 
RUS Bulletin 1770B–1, found on the 
agency’s Web site. 

Telecommunications means electronic 
transmission and reception of voice, 
data, video, and graphical information 
using wireline and wireless trans-
mission media. 

Telecommunications loan means any 
telecommunication loan made or guar-
anteed under Title II, III, or IV of the 
RE Act. 

TIER means times interest earned 
ratio. TIER is the ratio of an appli-
cant’s net income (after taxes) plus 
(adding back) interest expense, all di-
vided by interest expense (existing and 
that required in the proposed loan), 
and with all financial terms defined by 
GAAP. 

Unguaranteed loan amount means all 
amounts of payment on account of the 

guaranteed loan other than the guaran-
teed amount. 

Unguaranteed loan portion amount 
means all amounts of payment on ac-
count of any guaranteed loan portion 
other than the respective guaranteed 
loan portion amount. 

Unserved household or Unserved area 
means a household or an area that is 
not offered broadband service. 

(b) Accounting terms not otherwise 
defined in this part shall have the defi-
nition ascribed to them under GAAP 
and shall be recorded using the Agen-
cy’s system of accounts. 

§ 1738.3 Substantially underserved 
trust areas. 

(a) If the Administrator determines 
that a community within ‘‘trust land’’ 
(as defined in 38 U.S.C. 3765) has a high 
need for the benefits of the Broadband 
Loan Program, he/she may designate 
the community as a ‘‘substantially un-
derserved trust area’’ (as defined in 
section 306F of the RE Act). 

(b) To receive consideration as a sub-
stantially underserved trust area, the 
applicant must submit to the Agency a 
completed application that includes all 
of the information requested in 7 CFR 
part 1700, subpart D. In addition, the 
applicant must notify the Agency in 
writing that it seeks consideration as a 
substantially underserved trust area 
and identify the discretionary authori-
ties of 7 CFR part 1700, subpart D, it 
seeks to have applied to its applica-
tion. Note, however, that given the 
prohibition on funding operating ex-
penses in the Broadband Program, re-
quests for waiver of the equity or the 
additional cash requirements cannot be 
considered. 

§§ 1738.4–1738.50 [Reserved] 

Subpart B—Eligible and Ineligible 
Loan Purposes 

§ 1738.51 Eligible loan purposes. 

Loan funds may be used to pay for 
any of the following expenses: 

(a) To fund the construction, im-
provement, or acquisition of all facili-
ties required to provide service at the 
broadband lending speed to rural areas, 
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including facilities required for pro-
viding other services over the same fa-
cilities. 

(b) To fund the cost of leasing facili-
ties required to provide service at the 
broadband lending speed if such lease 
qualifies as a capital lease under 
GAAP. Notwithstanding, loan funds 
can only be used to fund the cost of the 
capital lease for no more than the first 
three years of the loan amortization 
period. If an IRU qualifies as a capital 
lease, the entire cost of the lease will 
be amortized over the life of the lease 
and only the first three years of the 
amortized cost can be funded. 

(c) To fund an acquisition, provided 
that: 

(1) The acquisition is necessary for 
furnishing or improving service at the 
broadband lending speed; 

(2) The acquired service area, if any, 
meets the eligibility requirements set 
forth in § 1738.102; 

(3) The acquisition cost does not ex-
ceed 50 percent of the broadband loan 
amount; and 

(4) For the acquisition of another en-
tity, the purchase provides the appli-
cant with a controlling majority inter-
est in the entity acquired. 

(d) To refinance an outstanding tele-
communications loan made under the 
RE Act if refinancing the loan supports 
the construction, improvement, or ac-
quisition of facilities and equipment 
for the provision of service at the 
broadband lending speed in rural areas 
provided that: 

(1) No more than 40 percent of the 
broadband loan amount is used to refi-
nance the outstanding telecommuni-
cations loan; 

(2) The applicant is current with its 
payments on the telecommunication 
loan(s) to be refinanced; and 

(3) The amortization period for that 
portion of the broadband loan that will 
be needed for refinancing will not ex-
ceed the remaining amortization pe-
riod for the telecommunications 
loan(s) to be refinanced. If multiple 
notes are being refinanced, an average 
remaining amortization period will be 
calculated based on the weighted dollar 
average of the notes being refinanced. 

(e) To fund pre-loan expenses in an 
amount not to exceed five percent of 
the broadband loan excluding amounts 

requested to refinance outstanding 
telecommunication loans. Pre-loan ex-
penses may be reimbursed only if they 
are incurred prior to the date on which 
notification of a complete application 
is issued (see § 1738.205), they meet the 
requirements for reimbursement (found 
on the agency’s Web site) and a loan 
contract is entered into with RUS. 

§ 1738.52 Ineligible loan purposes. 

Loan funds must not be used for any 
of the following purposes: 

(a) To fund operating expenses of the 
applicant; 

(b) To fund any costs associated with 
the project incurred prior to the date 
on which notification of a complete ap-
plication is issued (see § 1738.205), ex-
cept for eligible pre-loan expenses (see 
§ 1738.51(e)). 

(c) To fund the acquisition of the 
stock of an affiliate. 

(d) To fund the purchase or acquisi-
tion of any facilities or equipment of 
an affiliate, unless approved by the 
Agency in writing. The Agency may 
approve such a purchase or acquisition 
if the applicant demonstrates that the 
purchase or acquisition will involve an 
arms-length transaction and that the 
cost is advantageous for the applicant. 

(e) To fund the purchase of CPE and 
the installation of associated inside 
wiring, unless the CPE will be owned 
by the applicant throughout its eco-
nomic life: or 

(1) The applicant pledges additional 
collateral that is not currently owned 
by the applicant, acceptable to the 
Agency. Such collateral must have a 
value at least equal to the purchase 
price of the CPE and cannot be pur-
chased with loan funds; or 

(2) The applicant establishes a re-
volving fund for the initial purchase of 
CPE to be sold, and as CPE is sold to 
the customer, at least the applicant’s 
cost of such equipment is returned to 
the revolving fund and used to pur-
chase additional CPE units. 

(f) To fund the purchase or lease of 
any vehicle unless it is used primarily 
in construction or system improve-
ments. 

(g) To fund the cost of systems or fa-
cilities that have not been designed 
and constructed in accordance with the 
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loan contract and other applicable re-
quirements. 

(h) To fund broadband facilities 
leased under the terms of an operating 
lease. 

(i) To fund merger or consolidation of 
entities. 

§§ 1738.53—1738.100 [Reserved] 

Subpart C—Eligibility 
Requirements 

§ 1738.101 Eligible applicants. 
(a) To be eligible for a broadband 

loan, an applicant may be either a non-
profit or for-profit organization, and 
must take one of the following forms: 

(1) Corporation; 
(2) Limited liability company (LLC); 
(3) Cooperative or mutual organiza-

tion; 
(4) Indian tribe or tribal organization 

as defined in 25 U.S.C. 450b; or 
(5) State or local government, includ-

ing any agency, subdivision, or instru-
mentality thereof. 

(b) To be eligible for a broadband 
loan, the applicant must: 

(1) Submit a loan application which 
meets the requirements set forth in 
this part as well as any additional re-
quirements published in the FEDERAL 
REGISTER; 

(2) Agree to complete the build-out of 
the broadband system described in the 
loan application within three years 
from the day the applicant is notified 
that loan funds are available. Under 
the terms of the loan documents, this 
three-year period will commence 120 
days after the date of the loan con-
tract. The loan application must dem-
onstrate that all proposed construction 
can be completed within this three- 
year period with the exception of CPE. 
CPE can be funded throughout the 
forecast period; 

(3) Demonstrate an ability to furnish, 
improve, or extend broadband facilities 
to provide service at the broadband 
lending speed in the proposed funded 
service area; 

(4) Demonstrate an equity position 
equal to at least 10 percent of the 
amount of the loan requested in the ap-
plication (see § 1738.207); and 

(5) Provide additional security if it is 
necessary to ensure financial feasi-

bility (see § 1738.208) as determined by 
the Administrator. 

§ 1738.102 Eligible service area. 
(a) A service area may be eligible for 

a broadband loan if all of the following 
are true: 

(1) The proposed funded service area 
is completely contained within a rural 
area; 

(2) At least 15 percent of the house-
holds in the proposed funded service 
area are unserved households; 

(3) No part of the proposed funded 
service area has three or more incum-
bent service providers; and 

(4) No part of the proposed funded 
service area overlaps with the service 
area of current RUS borrowers, nor the 
services areas of grantees that were 
funded by RUS. 

(b) Multiple service areas may be in-
cluded in a single broadband loan ap-
plication. Non-contiguous areas are 
considered separate service areas and 
must be treated separately for the pur-
pose of determining service area eligi-
bility. If non-contiguous areas within 
an application are determined to be in-
eligible, the Agency may consider the 
remaining areas in the application for 
eligibility. If an applicant fails to re-
spond to Agency requests for addi-
tional information or modifications to 
remove ineligible areas, the applica-
tion will be rejected. 

(c) If no existing broadband service 
provider responds to the Public Notice 
as described in § 1738.204(b), then the 
number of incumbent service providers 
for § 1738.102(a)(3) will be determined by 
using: 

(1) The most current National 
Broadband Map; or 

(2) Any other data regarding the 
availability of broadband service that 
the Secretary may collect or obtain 
through reasonable efforts. 

(d) If a service provider is identified 
by methods described in paragraphs 
(c)(1) or (2) of this section, and the 
Agency is unable to determine whether 
such provider is an incumbent service 
provider, as defined herein, then the 
Agency will request the service pro-
vider to provide information respond-
ing to the Public Notice for the loan 
application, demonstrating that they 
meet the definition for an incumbent 
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service provider. If the service provider 
does not respond to the Agency’s re-
quest within 30 calendar days providing 
the necessary information to make a 
determination, the provider will not be 
considered an incumbent service pro-
vider. 

§ 1738.103 Eligible service area excep-
tions for broadband facility up-
grades. 

(a) Broadband borrowers that apply 
to upgrade existing broadband facili-
ties in their existing service area are 
exempt from the requirement con-
cerning the number of unserved house-
holds in § 1738.102(a)(2). 

(b) Incumbent service providers, in-
cluding borrowers and grantees, which 
apply to upgrade existing broadband fa-
cilities in existing service territories 
are exempt from the requirement con-
cerning the number of incumbent serv-
ice providers in § 1738.102(a)(3) unless 
they are eligible for funding under Ti-
tles II and III of the RE Act. Eligibility 
requirements for entities that would be 
eligible under Titles II and III can be 
found in 7 CFR part 1735. 

(c) An applicant which is a borrower, 
grantee or incumbent service provider 
may submit one application to upgrade 
existing broadband facilities in exist-
ing service areas, which qualify for the 
exemptions specified in paragraphs (a) 
and (b) of this section, and to expand 
services at the broadband lending speed 
into new service areas, provided the up-
grade area and the expansion area are 
proposed as two separate service areas 
even if the upgrade and expansion 
areas are contiguous. 

(d) The applicant will be asked to re-
move areas determined to be ineligible 
from their funding request or provide 
funds other than loan funds for these 
areas. The application will then be 
evaluated on the basis of what remains. 
The applicant may be requested to pro-
vide additional information to the 
Agency relating to the ineligible areas. 
If the applicant fails to respond, the 
application will be returned. 

§ 1738.104 Preliminary assessment of 
service area eligibility. 

(a) Upon request, the Agency will 
make information available to prospec-
tive applicants to allow a preliminary 

assessment of a proposed service area’s 
eligibility. At a minimum, the prospec-
tive applicant will be able to deter-
mine: 

(1) Whether the proposed service area 
is located in a rural area; 

(2) Whether the proposed service area 
overlaps with any part of a borrower’s 
or grantee’s service area; and 

(3) Whether the proposed service area 
overlaps with any part of a proposed 
service area in a pending application 
for a loan. 

(b) A preliminary assessment of serv-
ice area eligibility does not account for 
all eligibility factors, and the situation 
within a proposed service area may 
change between the preliminary assess-
ment and application submission. A 
preliminary assessment indicating that 
a proposed service area may be eligible 
does not guarantee that the area will 
remain eligible at the time of applica-
tion. 

§§ 1738.105—1738.150 [Reserved] 

Subpart D—Direct Loan Terms 
§ 1738.151 General. 

(a) Direct loans shall be in the form 
of a cost-of-money loan, a 4 percent 
loan, or a combination of the two. 

(b) The amount of funds available for 
each type of loan, as well as maximum 
and minimum loan amounts will be 
published in the FEDERAL REGISTER. 

(c) An applicant that provides tele-
communications or broadband service 
to at least 20 percent of the households 
in the United States is limited to a 
loan amount that is no more than 15 
percent of the funds available to the 
Broadband Loan Program for the Fed-
eral fiscal year. 

§ 1738.152 Interest rates. 
(a) Direct cost-of-money loans shall 

bear interest at a rate equal to the cost 
of borrowing to the Department of 
Treasury for obligations of comparable 
maturity. The applicable interest rate 
will be set at the time of each advance. 

(b) [Reserved] 

§ 1738.153 Loan terms and conditions. 
Terms and conditions of loans are set 

forth in a mortgage, note, and loan 
contract. Samples of the mortgage, 
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note, and loan contract can be found on 
the Agency’s Web site. 

(a) Unless requested to be shorter by 
the applicant, broadband loans must be 
repaid with interest within a period 
that, rounded to the nearest whole 
year, is equal to the expected com-
posite economic life of the assets to be 
financed, as determined by the Agency 
based upon acceptable depreciation 
rates. Expected composite economic 
life means the depreciated life plus 
three years. 

(b) Loan advances are made at the re-
quest of the borrower. Principal pay-
ments for each advance are amortized 
over the remaining term of the loan 
and are due monthly. Principal pay-
ments will be deferred until two years 
after the date of the first advance of 
loan funds. Interest begins accruing 
when the advance is made and interest 
payments are due monthly, with no de-
ferral period. 

(c) Borrowers are required to carry fi-
delity bond coverage. Generally this 
amount will be 15 percent of the loan 
amount, not to exceed $5 million. The 
Agency may reduce the percentage re-
quired if it determines that the amount 
is not commensurate with the risk in-
volved. 

§ 1738.154 Loan security. 
(a) The broadband loan must be se-

cured by the assets purchased with the 
loan funds, as well as all other assets of 
the applicant and any other signer of 
the loan documents except as provided 
in § 1738.155. 

(b) The Agency must be given an ex-
clusive first lien, in form and substance 
satisfactory to the Agency, on all of 
the applicant’s property and revenues 
and such additional security as the 
Agency may require. The Agency may 
share its first lien position with an-
other lender on a pari passu, prorated 
basis if security arrangements are ac-
ceptable to the Agency. 

(c) Unless otherwise designated by 
the Agency, all property purchased 
with loan funds must be owned by the 
applicant. 

(d) In the case of loans that include 
financing of facilities that do not con-
stitute self-contained operating sys-
tems, the applicant shall furnish assur-
ance, satisfactory to the Agency, that 

continuous and efficient service at the 
broadband lending speed will be ren-
dered. 

(e) The Agency will require adequate 
financial, investment, operational, re-
porting, and managerial controls in the 
loan documents. 

§ 1738.155 Special terms and condi-
tions. 

(a) When necessary to achieve finan-
cial feasibility and long-term sustain-
ability of a project proposing to serve 
an area(s) that includes at least 50 per-
cent unserved households, the Agency 
may consider applications in which the 
applicant has requested any of the fol-
lowing: 

(1) A principal deferral period longer 
than the 2 year principal deferral pe-
riod established in accordance with 
§ 1738.153(b), but in no event longer than 
4 years nor more than 40 percent of the 
maturity period of the loan as set forth 
in § 1738.153(a); 

(2) An extension of the loan term by 
25 percent of the maturity period es-
tablished in accordance with 
§ 1738.153(a), but in no event longer than 
35 years; and 

(3) A modification to the security re-
quirements, as long as the modifica-
tions are necessary to sustain the oper-
ation and do not prejudice the govern-
ment’s security for the loan. The modi-
fication must ensure that the proposed 
security arrangements are commensu-
rate with the risk of the project. 

(b) [Reserved] 

§ 1738.156 Other Federal requirements. 
(a) To receive a broadband loan, the 

applicant must certify or agree in writ-
ing to comply with all applicable Fed-
eral regulations including, but not lim-
ited to: 

(1) The nondiscrimination and equal 
employment opportunity requirements 
of Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of 
1964, as amended (7 CFR part 15); 

(2) Section 504 of the Rehabilitation 
Act of 1973, as amended (29 U.S.C. 794 et 
seq.; 7 CFR part 15b); 

(3) The Age Discrimination Act of 
1975, as amended (42 U.S.C. 6101 et seq.; 
45 CFR part 90); 

(4) Executive Order 11375, amending 
Executive Order (E.O.) 11246, Relating 
to Equal Employment Opportunity (3 
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CFR, 1966–1970). See 7 CFR parts 15 and 
15b and 45 CFR part 90, RUS Bulletin 
1790–1 (‘‘Nondiscrimination Among 
Beneficiaries of RUS Programs’’), and 
RUS Bulletin 20–15:320–15 (‘‘Equal Em-
ployment Opportunity in Construction 
Financed with RUS Loans’’), found on 
the agency’s Web site; 

(5) The Architectural Barriers Act of 
1968, as amended (42 U.S.C. 4151 et seq.); 

(6) The Uniform Federal Accessibility 
Standards (UFAS) (Appendix A to 41 
CFR subpart 101–19.6); 

(7) The requirements of the National 
Environmental Policy Act of 1969 
(NEPA), as amended; 

(8) The Council on Environmental 
Quality Regulations for Implementing 
the Procedural Provisions of NEPA and 
certain related Federal environmental 
laws, statutes, regulations, and Execu-
tive Orders found in 7 CFR part 1794, 
and any successor regulation; 

(9) The Uniform Relocation Assist-
ance and Real Property Acquisition 
Policies Act of 1970, as amended, 42 
U.S.C. 4601 et seq., and with imple-
menting Federal regulations in 49 CFR 
part 24 and 7 CFR part 21; 

(10) The regulations implementing 
E.O. 12549, Debarment and Suspension, 
2 CFR parts 180 and 417; 

(11) The requirements regarding Lob-
bying for Contracts, Grants, Loans, and 
Cooperative Agreements in 31 U.S.C. 
1352; 

(12) Certification regarding Flood 
Hazard Area Precautions; 

(13) Certification regarding Debar-
ment, Suspension, and Other Responsi-
bility Matters—Primary Covered 
Transactions; and 

(14) Certification that the borrower is 
not delinquent on any Federal debt and 
has been informed of the collection op-
tions the Federal Government may use 
to collect delinquent debt. 

(b) Applicants must agree in writing 
to comply with all Federal, State and 
local laws, rules, regulations, ordi-
nances, codes, and orders applicable to 
the project. 

§§ 1738.157—1739.200 [Reserved] 

Subpart E—Application Review 
and Underwriting 

§ 1738.201 Application submission. 
(a) Loan applications must be sub-

mitted directly to the Agency’s Na-
tional Office. All applications must 
contain two hard copies and an elec-
tronic copy of the entire application. 
An application is considered received 
upon receipt of the hard and electronic 
copies by the National Office. 

(b) The Agency is developing an on-
line application system. Once the sys-
tem becomes available, all applicants 
will be required to submit applications 
through the online system. 

(c) The Agency may publish addi-
tional application submission require-
ments in the FEDERAL REGISTER. 

§ 1738.202 Elements of a complete ap-
plication. 

Applications must be submitted in 
the format required by the Rural 
Broadband Access Loan and Loan 
Guarantee Program Application Guide 
(the Application Guide), available on 
the agency’s Web site, so that applica-
tions can be uniformly evaluated and 
compared. To be considered complete, 
an application must contain at least 
the following items, in form and sub-
stance acceptable to the Agency: 

(a) A completed RUS Form 532, in-
cluding any additional items required 
by the form; 

(b) Information required for the pub-
lic notice to determine service area eli-
gibility (see § 1738.204); 

(c) Documentation demonstrating 
how the applicant will meet the equity 
requirement of § 1738.207; 

(d) A market survey, unless not re-
quired by § 1738.209(b); 

(e) A competitive analysis of the en-
tire proposed service territory(ies) (see 
§ 1738.210); 

(f) The historical and projected finan-
cial information required in § 1738.211; 

(g) A network design, which also 
demonstrates the ability to provide 
service at the broadband lending speed 
(see § 1738.212); 

(h) A legal opinion that addresses the 
applicant’s ability to enter into a loan 
as requested in the loan application, to 
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pledge security as required by the 
Agency, to describe all pending litiga-
tion matters, and such other require-
ments as are detailed in the Applica-
tion Guide; 

(i) Documentation proving that all 
required licenses and regulatory ap-
provals for the proposed operation have 
been obtained, or the status of obtain-
ing such licenses or approvals; and 

(j) Additional items that may be re-
quired by the Administrator through a 
notice in the FEDERAL REGISTER. 

§ 1738.203 Priority for approving loan 
applications. 

(a) The Agency will compare and 
evaluate all applications that have 
been submitted for funding and deemed 
to be complete no less than twice a 
year, and shall give priority to applica-
tions in the following order (Note that 
for applications containing multiple 
proposed funded service areas, the per-
centage will be calculated combining 
all proposed funded service areas.): 

(1) Applications in which no 
broadband service, as defined herein is 
available in the proposed funded serv-
ice area; 

(2) Applications in which at least 75 
percent of households in the proposed 
funded service area have no broadband 
service; 

(3) Applications in which at least 50 
percent of households in the proposed 
funded service area have no broadband 
service; 

(4) Applications in which at least 25 
percent of households in the proposed 
funded service area have no broadband 
service; and 

(5) Applications in which at least 25 
percent of the customers in the pro-
posed service area are commercial in-
terests and predominately more house-
holds are proposed to be served than 
businesses. 

(b) Once applications have been de-
termined to be complete, they will be 
compared and prioritized according to 
the criteria listed in paragraph (a) 
above, and subject to available funding 
levels. 

(c) If two or more applications are 
tied for a place in the processing queue, 
the application that promotes 
broadband adoption will be given pri-

ority over applications that do not pro-
mote broadband adoption. 

(d) The Agency shall establish the 
National and State reserve levels in ac-
cordance with Title VI of the RE Act 
when feasible given the level of funds 
available for the program. In instances 
when funds in a particular area are in-
sufficient to cover a loan request, pri-
ority will be given to applications for 
which funding is available. 

§ 1738.204 Public notice. 
(a) The Agency will publish a public 

notice of each application. The applica-
tion must provide a summary of the in-
formation required for such public no-
tice including all of the following in-
formation: 

(1) The identity of the applicant; 
(2) A map of each service area show-

ing the rural area boundaries and the 
unserved areas using the Agency’s 
Mapping Tool; 

(3) The amount and type of support 
requested; 

(4) The status of the review of the ap-
plication; 

(5) The estimated number of unserved 
households in each service area exclu-
sive of satellite broadband service; 

(6) A description of all the types of 
services that the applicant proposes to 
offer in each service area; and 

(7) A list of the census block groups 
proposed to be served. 

(b) The Agency will publish the pub-
lic notice on an Agency Web page after 
the application has been received in 
the Agency’s National Office and will 
remain on the Web page for a period of 
30 calendar days. The notice will ask 
existing service providers to submit to 
the Agency, within this notice period, 
the following information: 

(1) The number of residential and 
business customers within the appli-
cant’s service area that are currently 
offered broadband service by the exist-
ing service provider; 

(2) The number of residential and 
business customers within the appli-
cant’s service area currently pur-
chasing the existing service provider’s 
broadband service, the rates of data 
transmission being offered, and the 
cost of each level of broadband service 
charged by the existing service pro-
vider; 
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(3) The number of residential and 
business customers within the appli-
cant’s service area receiving the exist-
ing service provider’s non-broadband 
services and the associated rates for 
these other services; 

(4) A map showing where the existing 
service provider’s services coincide 
with the applicant’s service area using 
the Agency’s Mapping Tool; and 

(5) Whether the existing service pro-
vider is an existing RUS borrower or 
grantee. 

(c) The Agency will use the informa-
tion submitted to determine if the ex-
isting service provider will be classified 
as an incumbent service provider. Not-
withstanding non-responses by existing 
providers, the Agency will use all infor-
mation available to it in evaluating 
the feasibility of the loan. 

(d) The Agency will determine wheth-
er the service areas included in the ap-
plication are eligible for funding based 
on all available information. If part or 
parts of the applicant’s proposed fund-
ed service area are ineligible, the Agen-
cy will contact the applicant and re-
quire that those ineligible areas be re-
moved from the proposed funded serv-
ice area or that other funding be pro-
vided. If the ineligible service areas are 
not removed from the funding request 
or additional funds are not provided, 
the Agency will reject the application. 
Given that applications may need to be 
revised to reflect modified service 
areas, applicants are encouraged to re- 
submit their applications as soon as 
possible to avoid that their applica-
tions will not be considered for the cur-
rent evaluation period. 

(e) The information submitted by an 
existing service provider will be treat-
ed as proprietary and confidential to 
the extent permitted under applicable 
law. 

(f) If an application is approved, an 
additional notice will be published on 
the agency’s Web site that will include 
the following information: 

(1) The name of the entity receiving 
the financial assistance; 

(2) The type of assistance being re-
ceived; and 

(3) The purpose of the assistance; 
(g) The semiannual reports submitted 

under § 1738.254(e). 

§ 1738.205 Notification of complete-
ness. 

If all proposed funded service areas 
are eligible, the Agency will review the 
application for completeness. The com-
pleteness review will include an assess-
ment of whether all required docu-
ments and information have been sub-
mitted and whether the information 
provided is of adequate quality to allow 
further analysis. 

(a) If the application contains all 
documents and information required by 
this part and is sufficient, in form and 
substance acceptable to the Agency, 
the Agency will notify the applicant, in 
writing, that the application is com-
plete. A notification of completeness is 
not a commitment that the loan will 
be approved. By submitting an applica-
tion, the applicant acknowledges that 
no obligation to enter into a loan ex-
ists until actual loan documents have 
been executed. 

(b) If the application is considered to 
be incomplete or inadequate, the Agen-
cy will notify the applicant, in writing, 
that the application has been rejected. 
The rejection letter will include an ex-
planation of the reasons for rejection. 

§ 1738.206 Evaluation for feasibility. 
After an applicant is notified that 

the application is complete, the Agen-
cy will evaluate the application’s fi-
nancial and technical feasibility. Only 
applications that, as determined by the 
Agency, are technically and financially 
feasible will be considered for funding. 

(a) The Agency will determine finan-
cial feasibility by evaluating the im-
pact of the facilities financed with the 
proceeds of the loan and the associated 
debt, the applicant’s equity, market 
survey (if required), competitive anal-
ysis, financial information, and other 
relevant information in the applica-
tion. 

(b) The Agency will determine tech-
nical feasibility by evaluating the ap-
plicant’s network design and other rel-
evant information in the application. 

§ 1738.207 Equity requirement. 
(a) To be eligible for a loan, an appli-

cant must demonstrate a minimum eq-
uity contribution equal to 10 percent of 
the requested loan amount at the time 
of application which must remain 
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available at loan closing. In addition to 
the 10 percent minimum equity re-
quirement, § 1738.208 provides addi-
tional cash requirements that may be 
required in support of the loan. 

(b) If the applicant does not have the 
required equity at the time the appli-
cation is submitted, the applicant may 
satisfy the equity requirement at the 
time of application with an investor’s 
unconditional legal commitment to 
cover the shortfall by providing addi-
tional equity. The additional equity 
must be transferred to the applicant 
prior to loan closing. If this option is 
elected, the applicant must provide 
evidence in the application that clearly 
identifies the investor’s commitment 
to the applicant; the amount, terms, 
and conditions of the investment; and 
the investor’s bank or financial state-
ments that demonstrate its ability to 
fulfill its commitment. The terms and 
conditions of the investment must be 
acceptable to the Agency, but at a min-
imum cannot be secured by any assets 
of the applicant nor provide that the 
investment will be available when cer-
tain requirements or other thresholds 
are met by the applicant. The Agency 
will reject applications that do not pro-
vide evidence acceptable to the Agency 
regarding the investor’s commitment. 

(c) For State and local government 
applicants, the equity requirement can 
be satisfied with a general obligation 
bond, as long as the additional equity 
will be available to the applicant at 
closing. If the equity requirement is 
satisfied with a general obligation 
bond, the broadband loan cannot be 
subordinate to the bond. The applicant 
must submit an opinion from its legal 
counsel that the applicant has the au-
thority to issue a general obligation 
bond in an amount sufficient to meet 
the minimum equity requirement. Rev-
enue bonds supported by the operations 
to be funded cannot be used to satisfy 
the equity requirement. 

§ 1738.208 Additional cash require-
ments. 

(a) If the Agency’s financial analysis 
indicates that the applicant’s entire 
operation (existing operations and new 
operations combined) will show an in-
adequate cash balance at the end of 
any year during the five-year forecast 

period, the Agency will require the ap-
plicant to obtain additional cash infu-
sions necessary to maintain an appro-
priate cash balance throughout the 
five-year forecast period. This cash in-
fusion would be in conjunction with 
the required 10 percent minimum eq-
uity position. 

(1) The Agency will require the appli-
cant and its investors to: 

(i) Infuse additional cash to cover 
projected deficits for the first two 
years of operations at loan closing; and 

(ii) Enter into legal arrangements 
that commit them to making addi-
tional cash infusions to ensure that the 
operation will sustain a positive cash 
position on a quarterly basis through-
out the five-year forecast period. 

(2) For purposes of identifying the ad-
ditional cash requirement for a start- 
up operation or an operation that has 
not demonstrated positive cash flow for 
the two years prior to the submission 
date of the application, 50 percent of 
projected revenues for each year of the 
five-year forecast period will be consid-
ered to determine if an operation can 
sustain a positive cash position. In ad-
dition to the initial financial projec-
tions required to demonstrate financial 
feasibility, such applicants must com-
plete adjusted financial projections 
using the reduced revenue projections 
in order to identify the amount of addi-
tional cash that will be required. Pro-
jections must be fully supported with 
assumptions acceptable to the Agency. 
The applicant may present evidence in 
its loan application that projected rev-
enues or a portion of projected reve-
nues are based on binding commit-
ments and request that more than 50 
percent of the projected revenues be 
considered for the purpose of identi-
fying the additional cash requirement. 

(3) For purposes of satisfying the ad-
ditional cash requirements for an exist-
ing operation that has demonstrated a 
positive cash flow for the two fiscal 
years prior to the submission date of 
the application, 100 percent of the pro-
jected revenues for each year of the 
five-year forecast period will be used to 
determine if an operation can sustain a 
positive cash position, as long as these 
projections are fully supported with as-
sumptions acceptable to the Agency. 
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(4) If debt is incurred to satisfy the 
additional cash requirement, this debt 
must take a subordinate lien position 
to the Agency debt and must be at 
terms acceptable to the Agency. 

(b) An applicant may satisfy the ad-
ditional cash requirement with an un-
conditional, irrevocable letter of credit 
(LOC) satisfactory to the Agency. The 
LOC must be issued from a financial in-
stitution acceptable to the Agency and 
must remain in effect throughout the 
forecast period. The applicant and the 
Agency must both be payees under the 
LOC. The LOC must have payment con-
ditions acceptable to the Agency, and 
it must be in place prior to loan clos-
ing. The applicant cannot secure the 
LOC with its assets and cannot pay for 
any LOC charges or fees with its funds. 

(c) If the Agency offers a loan to the 
applicant, the applicant must ensure 
that the additional cash infusion re-
quired in the first two years is depos-
ited into its bank account within 120 
days from the date the applicant signs 
the loan offer letter (see § 1738.251) and 
must enter into any other legal ar-
rangements necessary to cover further 
projected operating deficits (or in the 
case of the LOC, to provide an accept-
able LOC to the Agency) prior to clos-
ing. If these requirements are not com-
pleted within this timeframe, the loan 
offer will be terminated, unless the ap-
plicant requests and the Agency ap-
proves an extension based on extenu-
ating circumstances that the Agency 
was not aware of at the time the offer 
was made. 

§ 1738.209 Market survey. 

(a) Except as provided in paragraph 
(b) of this section, the applicant must 
complete a separate market survey for 
each service area where the applicant 
proposes to provide service at the 
broadband lending speed. Each market 
survey must demonstrate the need for 
the service at the broadband lending 
speed, support the projected penetra-
tion rates and price points for the serv-
ices to be offered, and support the fea-
sibility analysis. The market survey 
must also address all other services 
that will be provided in connection 
with the broadband loan. Additional in-
formation on the requirements of the 

market survey can be found in the Ap-
plication Guide. 

(b) The applicant is not required to 
complete a market survey for any serv-
ice offering for which the applicant is 
projecting less than a 20 percent pene-
tration rate in each service area by the 
end of the five-year forecast period. 
For example, if the applicant is pro-
jecting a penetration rate of 30 percent 
for data services and 15 percent for 
video services, a market survey must 
be completed for the data services. The 
proposed prices for those services with 
a projected penetration rate less than 
20 percent must be affordable, as deter-
mined by the Agency. 

(c) For a market survey to be accept-
able to the Agency, it must have been 
completed within six months of the ap-
plication submission date. The Agency 
may reject any application in which 
the financial projections are not sup-
ported by the market survey. If the de-
mographics of the proposed service 
area have significantly changed since 
the survey was completed, the Agency 
may require an updated market survey. 

§ 1738.210 Competitive analysis. 

The applicant must submit a com-
petitive market analysis for each serv-
ice area regardless of projected pene-
tration rates. Each analysis must iden-
tify all existing service providers and 
all resellers in each service area re-
gardless of the provider’s market 
share, for each type of service the ap-
plicant proposes to provide. This anal-
ysis must include each competitor’s 
rate packages for all services offered, 
the area that is being covered, and to 
the extent possible, the quality of serv-
ice being provided. 

§ 1738.211 Financial information. 

(a) The applicant must submit finan-
cial information acceptable to the 
Agency that demonstrates that the ap-
plicant has the financial capacity to 
fulfill the loan requirements and to 
successfully complete the proposed 
project. 

(1) If the applicant is an existing 
company, it must provide complete 
copies of audited financial statements 
(opinion letter, balance sheet, income 
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statement, statement of changes in fi-
nancial position, and notes to the fi-
nancial statement) for the three fiscal 
years preceding the application sub-
mission. If audited statements are not 
available, the applicant must submit 
unaudited financial statements and tax 
returns for those fiscal years. Applica-
tions from start-up entities must, at a 
minimum, provide an opening balance 
sheet dated within 30 days of the final 
submission of all application material. 

(2) If the applicant is a subsidiary op-
eration, it must also provide complete 
copies of audited financial statements 
for the parent operation for the fiscal 
year preceding the application submis-
sion. If audited statements are not 
available, unaudited financial state-
ments and tax returns for the previous 
year must be submitted. 

(3) If the applicant relies on services 
provided by an affiliated operation, it 
must also provide complete copies of 
audited financial statements for any 
affiliate for the fiscal year preceding 
the application submission. If audited 
statements are not available, 
unaudited statements and tax returns 
for the previous year must be sub-
mitted. 

(4) Applicants must provide a list of 
all its outstanding obligations. Copies 
of existing notes and loan and security 
agreements must be included in the ap-
plication. 

(5) Applicants must provide a de-
tailed description of working capital 
requirements and the source of these 
funds. 

(b) Applicants must submit the fol-
lowing documents that demonstrate 
the proposed project’s financial viabil-
ity and ability to repay the requested 
loan. 

(1) Customer projections for the five- 
year forecast period that substantiate 
the projected revenues for each service 
that is to be provided. The projections 
must be provided on at least an annual 
basis and must be developed separately 
for each service area. These projections 
must be clearly supported by the infor-
mation contained in the market sur-
vey, unless no market survey is re-
quired (see § 1738.209(b)). 

(2) Annual financial projections in 
the form of balance sheets, income 
statements, and cash flow statements 

for the five-year forecast period. Prior 
to the submission of an application, an 
applicant may request that alternative 
information related to financial viabil-
ity be considered when the applicant 
can for good cause demonstrate why a 
full five year forecast cannot be pro-
vided. If this request is approved by the 
Agency, then the applicant can submit 
the application using the alternative 
information that was approved. 

(i) These projections must use a sys-
tem of accounts acceptable to the 
Agency and be supported by a detailed 
narrative that fully explains the meth-
odology and assumptions used to de-
velop the projections. 

(ii) The financial projections sub-
mitted by the applicant must dem-
onstrate that their entire operation 
will be able to meet a minimum TIER 
requirement equal to 1.25 by the end of 
the five-year forecast period. Dem-
onstrating that the operation can 
achieve a projected TIER of 1.25 does 
not ensure that the Agency will ap-
prove the loan. 

(iii) If the financial analysis suggests 
that the operation will not be able to 
achieve the required TIER ratio, the 
Agency will not approve the loan with-
out additional capital, additional cash, 
additional security, and/or a change in 
the loan terms. 

(c) Based on the financial evaluation, 
the loan documents will specify TIER 
requirements that must be met 
throughout the amortization period. 

§ 1738.212 Network design. 

(a) Applications must include a net-
work design that demonstrates the 
project’s technical feasibility. The net-
work design must fully support the de-
livery of service at the broadband lend-
ing speed, together with any other 
services to be provided. In measuring 
speed, the Agency will take into ac-
count industry and regulatory stand-
ards. The design must demonstrate 
that the project will be complete with-
in three years from the day the Agency 
notifies the applicant that loan funds 
are available and must include the fol-
lowing items: 

(1) A detailed description of the pro-
posed technology that will be used to 
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provide service at the broadband lend-
ing speed. This description must clear-
ly demonstrate that all households in 
the proposed funded service area will 
be offered service at the broadband 
lending speed; 

(2) A detailed description of the ex-
isting network. This description should 
provide a synopsis of the current net-
work infrastructure; 

(3) A detailed description of the pro-
posed network. This description should 
provide a synopsis of the proposed net-
work infrastructure; 

(4) A description of the approach and 
methodology for monitoring ongoing 
service delivery and service quality for 
the services being deployed; 

(5) Estimated project costs detailing 
all facilities that are required to com-
plete the project. These estimated 
costs must be broken down to indicate 
costs associated with each proposed 
service area and must specify how 
Agency and non-Agency funds will be 
used to complete the project; 

(6) A construction build-out schedule 
of the proposed facilities by service 
area on a quarterly basis. The build- 
out schedule must include: 

(i) A description of the work force 
that will be required to complete the 
proposed construction; 

(ii) A timeline demonstrating project 
completion within three years and four 
months from the date of the loan con-
tract; 

(iii) Detailed information showing 
that all households within the proposed 
funded service area will be offered serv-
ice at the broadband lending speed 
when the system is complete; and 

(iv) Detailed information showing 
that construction of the proposed fa-
cilities will start within six months 
from the date the Agency notifies the 
borrower that loan funds are available. 

(7) A depreciation schedule for all fa-
cilities financed with loan and non- 
loan funds; 

(8) An environmental report prepared 
in accordance with 7 CFR part 1794 or 
successor environmental policies and 
procedures; and 

(9) Any other system requirements 
required by the Administrator through 
a notice published in the FEDERAL REG-
ISTER. 

(b) The network design must be pre-
pared by a registered Professional En-
gineer with telecommunications expe-
rience or by qualified personnel on the 
applicant’s staff. If the network design 
is prepared by the applicant’s staff, the 
application must clearly demonstrate 
the staff’s qualifications, experience, 
and ability to complete the network 
design. To be considered qualified, staff 
must have at least three years of expe-
rience in designing the type of 
broadband system proposed in the ap-
plication. 

§ 1738.213 Loan determination. 
(a) If the application meets all statu-

tory and regulatory requirements and 
the feasibility study demonstrates that 
the TIER requirement can be satisfied 
and the business plan is sustainable, 
the application will be submitted to 
the Agency’s credit committees for 
consideration according to the prior-
ities in § 1738.203. Such submission of an 
application to the Agency’s credit com-
mittees does not guarantee that a loan 
will be approved. In making a loan de-
termination, the Administrator shall 
consider the recommendations of the 
credit committees. 

(b) The applicant will be notified of 
the Agency’s decision in writing. If the 
Agency does not approve the loan, a re-
jection letter will be sent to the appli-
cant, and the application will be re-
turned with an explanation of the rea-
sons for the rejection. 

§§ 1738.214–1738.250 [Reserved] 

Subpart F—Closing, Servicing, and 
Reporting 

§ 1738.251 Loan offer and loan closing. 
The Agency will notify the applicant 

of the loan offer, in writing, and the 
date by which the applicant must ac-
cept the offer. If the applicant accepts 
the terms of the loan offer, a loan con-
tract executed by the Agency will be 
sent to the applicant. The applicant 
must execute the loan contract and 
satisfy all conditions precedent to loan 
closing within the timeframe specified 
by the Agency. If the conditions are 
not met within this timeframe, the 
loan offer will be terminated, unless 
the applicant requests, and the Agency 
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approves, an extension. The Agency 
may approve such a request if the ap-
plicant has diligently sought to meet 
the conditions required for loan closing 
and has been unable to do so for rea-
sons outside its control. 

§ 1738.252 Construction. 
(a) Construction paid for with 

broadband loan funds must comply 
with 7 CFR part 1788, 7 CFR part 1794, 
RUS Bulletin 1738–2, and any successor 
regulations found on the agency’s Web 
site, and any other guidance from the 
Agency. 

(b) Once the Agency has extended a 
loan offer, the applicant, at its own 
risk, may start construction that is in-
cluded in the loan application on an in-
terim financing basis. For this con-
struction to be eligible for reimburse-
ment with loan funds, all construction 
procedures contained in this part must 
be followed. Note, however, that the 
Agency’s extension of a loan offer is 
not a guarantee that a loan will be 
made, unless and until a loan contract 
has been entered into between the ap-
plicant and RUS. 

(c) The build-out must be complete 
within three years and 4 months from 
the date of the loan contract. Build-out 
is considered complete when the net-
work design has been fully imple-
mented, the service operations and 
management systems infrastructure is 
operational, and the borrower is ready 
to support the activation and commis-
sioning of individual customers to the 
new system. 

§ 1738.253 Servicing. 
(a) Borrowers must make payments 

on the broadband loan as required in 
the note. 

(b) Borrowers must comply with all 
terms, conditions, affirmative cov-
enants, and negative covenants con-
tained in the loan documents. 

(c) In the event of default of any re-
quired payment or other term or condi-
tion: 

(1) A late charge shall be charged on 
any payment not made in accordance 
with the terms of the note. 

(2) The Agency may exercise the de-
fault remedies provided in the loan 
documents and any remedy permitted 
by law, but is not required to do so. 

(3) If the Agency chooses to not exer-
cise its default remedies, it does not 
waive its right to do so in the future. 

§ 1738.254 Accounting, reporting, and 
monitoring requirements. 

(a) Borrowers must adopt a system of 
accounts for maintaining financial 
records acceptable to the Agency, as 
described in 7 CFR part 1770, subpart B. 

(b) Borrowers must submit annual 
audited financial statements along 
with a report on compliance and on in-
ternal control over financial reporting, 
and management letter in accordance 
with the requirements of 7 CFR part 
1773. The Certified Public Accountant 
(CPA) conducting the annual audit is 
selected by the borrower and must be 
approved by RUS as set forth in 7 CFR 
1773.4. 

(c) Borrowers must comply with all 
reasonable Agency requests to support 
ongoing monitoring efforts. The Bor-
rower shall afford RUS, through its 
representatives, reasonable oppor-
tunity, at all times during business 
hours and upon prior notice, to have 
access to and the right to inspect the 
Broadband System, and any other 
property encumbered by the Mortgage, 
and any or all books, records, accounts, 
invoices, contracts, leases, payrolls, 
timesheets, cancelled checks, state-
ments, and other documents, electronic 
or paper of every kind belonging to or 
in the possession of the Borrower or in 
any way pertaining to its property or 
business, including its subsidiaries, if 
any, and to make copies or extracts 
therefore. 

(d) Borrower records shall be retained 
and preserved in accordance with the 
provisions of 7 CFR part 1770, subpart 
A. 

(e) Borrowers must submit semi-
annual reports for 3 years after comple-
tion of the project. The reports must 
include the following information: 

(1) The purpose of the financing, in-
cluding new equipment and capacity 
enhancements that support high-speed 
broadband access for educational insti-
tutions, health care providers, and pub-
lic safety service providers (including 
the estimated number of end users who 
are currently using or forecasted to use 
the new or upgraded infrastructure); 
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(2) The progress towards fulfilling the 
objectives for which the assistance was 
granted, including: 

(i) The number and location of resi-
dences and businesses that will receive 
service at or greater than the 
broadband lending speed; 

(ii) The types of facilities con-
structed and installed; 

(iii) The speed of the broadband serv-
ices being delivered; 

(iv) The average price of the 
broadband services being delivered in 
each proposed service area; 

(v) The broadband adoption rate for 
each proposed service territory, includ-
ing the number of new subscribers gen-
erated from the facilities funded; and 

(3) Any other reporting requirements 
established by the Administrator by 
notice in the FEDERAL REGISTER. 

§ 1738.255 Default and de-obligation. 
If a default under the loan documents 

occurs and such default has not been 
cured within the timeframes estab-
lished in the loan documents, the Ap-
plicant acknowledges that the Agency 
may, depending on the seriousness of 
the default, take any of the following 
actions: 

(a) To the greatest extent possible re-
cover the maximum amount of loan 
funds. 

(b) De-obligate all funds that have 
not been advanced; and 

(c) Reallocate recovered funds to the 
extent possible as prescribed by the Of-
fice of Management and Budget. 

§§ 1738.256–1738.300 [Reserved] 

Subpart G—Loan Guarantee 

§ 1738.301 General. 
(a) Applicants wishing to obtain a 

loan guarantee for private financing 
are subject to the same requirements 
as direct loan borrowers with respect 
to: 

(1) Loan purposes as described in sub-
part B of this part; 

(2) Eligible borrowers and eligible 
areas as described in subpart C of this 
part; 

(3) The loan terms described in sub-
part D of this part, with the exception 
of the interest rates described in 
§ 1738.152; 

(4) The application review and under-
writing requirements in subpart E of 
this part; and 

(5) The accounting, reporting, and 
monitoring requirements of subpart F 
of this part. 

(b) The Agency will publish a notice 
in the FEDERAL REGISTER indicating 
any additional requirements, as well as 
the amount of funds available, if any, 
for loan guarantees. 

§ 1738.302 Eligible guaranteed lenders. 

To be eligible for a loan guarantee, a 
guaranteed lender must be: 

(a) A financial institution in good 
standing that has been a concurrent 
lender with RUS; or 

(b) A legally organized lending insti-
tution, such as commercial bank, trust 
company, mortgage banking firm, in-
surance company, or any other institu-
tional investor authorized by law to 
loan money, which must be subject to 
credit examination and supervision by 
a Federal or State agency, unless the 
Agency determines that alternative ex-
amination and supervisory mechanisms 
are adequate. 

§ 1738.303 Requirements for the loan 
guarantee. 

At the time of application, applicants 
must provide in form and substance ac-
ceptable to the Agency: 

(a) Evidence of the guaranteed lend-
er’s eligibility under § 1738.302; 

(b) Evidence that the guaranteed 
lender has the demonstrated capacity 
to adequately service the guaranteed 
loan; 

(c) Evidence that the guaranteed 
lender is in good standing with its li-
censing authority and meets the loan 
making, loan servicing, and other re-
quirements of the jurisdiction in which 
the lender makes loans; 

(d) Evidence satisfactory to the 
Agency of its qualification under this 
part, along with the name of the au-
thority that supervises it; 

(e) A commitment letter from the 
guaranteed lender that will be pro-
viding the funding, and the terms of 
such funding, all of which may be con-
ditioned on final approval of the 
broadband loan guarantee by the Agen-
cy; and 
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(f) A description of any and all 
charges and fees for the loan, along 
with documentation that they are com-
parable to those normally charged 
other applicants for the same type of 
loan in the ordinary course of business. 
Such charges and fees will not be in-
cluded within the Agency’s loan guar-
antee. 

§ 1738.304 Terms for guarantee. 
Loan guarantees will only be given 

on the conditions that: 
(a) The loan guarantee is no more 

than 80 percent of the principal 
amount, which shall exclude any and 
all charges and fees; 

(b) The guarantee is limited to the 
outstanding loan repayment obligation 
of the borrower and does not extend to 
guaranteeing that the guaranteed lend-
er will remit to a holder, loan pay-
ments made by the borrower; 

(c) The interest rate must be fixed 
and must be the same or lesser for the 
guaranteed loan amount or the respec-
tive guaranteed loan portion amount 
or the respective guaranteed amount 
equivalent, as the case may be, and 
unguaranteed loan amount or the re-
spective unguaranteed loan portion 
amount or the respective 
unguaranteed-amount equivalent, as 
the case may be; 

(d) The entire loan will be secured by 
the same security with equal lien pri-
ority for the guaranteed loan amount 
or the respective guaranteed loan por-
tion amount or the respective guaran-
teed-amount equivalent, as the case 
may be, and unguaranteed loan amount 
or the respective unguaranteed loan 
portion amount or the respective 
unguaranteed-amount equivalent, as 
the case may be; 

(e) The unguaranteed loan amount or 
the respective unguaranteed loan por-
tion amount or the respective 
unguaranteed-amount equivalent, as 
the case may be, will neither be paid 
first nor given any preference or pri-
ority over the guaranteed loan amount 
or the respective guaranteed loan por-
tion amount or the respective guaran-
teed-amount equivalent, as the case 
may be; 

(f) Prior written approval is obtained 
from the Agency for any assignment by 
the guaranteed lender. Any assignment 

shall entitle the holder to all of the 
guaranteed lender’s rights but shall 
maintain the guaranteed lender respon-
sible for servicing the entire loan; 

(g) The borrower, its principal offi-
cers, members of the borrower’s board 
of directors and members of the imme-
diate families of said officials shall not 
be a holder of the guaranteed lender’s 
loan; 

(h) The Agency will not guarantee 
any loan under this subpart that pro-
vides for a balloon payment of prin-
cipal or interest at the final maturity 
date of the loan or for the payment of 
interest on interest; 

(i) All loan guarantee documents be-
tween the Agency and the guaranteed 
lender are prepared by the Agency; and 

(j) The loan agreement between the 
borrower and the lender shall be sub-
ject to Agency approval. 

§ 1738.305 Obligations of guaranteed 
lender. 

Once a loan guarantee has been ap-
proved, the guaranteed lender will be 
responsible for: 

(a) Servicing the loan; 
(b) Determining that all prerequisites 

to each advance of loan funds by the 
lender under the terms of the contract 
of guarantee, all financing documents, 
and all related security documents 
have been fulfilled; 

(c) Obtaining approval from the 
Agency to advance funds prior to each 
advance; 

(d) Billing and collecting loan pay-
ments from the borrower; 

(e) Notifying the Administrator 
promptly of any default in the pay-
ment of principal and interest on the 
loan and submit a report no later than 
30 days thereafter, setting forth the 
reasons for the default, how long it ex-
pects the borrower will be in default, 
and what corrective actions the bor-
rower states that it is taking to 
achieve a current debt service position; 
and 

(f) Notifying the Administrator of 
any known violations or defaults by 
the borrower under the lending agree-
ment, contract of guarantee, or related 
security instruments or conditions of 
which the lender is aware which might 
lead to nonpayment, violation, or other 
default. 
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§ 1738.306 Agency rights and remedies. 

(a) The guarantee must provide that 
upon notice to the lender, the Agency 
may assume loan servicing responsibil-
ities for the loan or the guaranteed 
loan amount or the respective guaran-
teed loan portion amount or the re-
spective guaranteed-amount equiva-
lent, as the case may be, or require the 
lender to assign such responsibilities to 
a different entity, if the lender fails to 
perform its loan servicing responsibil-
ities under the loan guarantee agree-
ment, or if the lender becomes insol-
vent, makes an admission in writing of 
its inability to pay its debts generally 
as they become due, or becomes the 
subject of proceedings commenced 
under the Bankruptcy Reform Act of 
1978, as amended (11 U.S.C. 101 et seq.) 
or any similar applicable Federal or 
State law, or is no longer in good 
standing with its licensing authority, 
or ceases to meet the eligibility re-
quirements of this subpart. Such neg-
ligent servicing is defined as the fail-
ure to perform those services which a 
reasonable prudent lender would per-
form in servicing its own portfolio of 
loans that are not guaranteed and in-
cludes not only a failure to act but also 
not acting in a timely manner. 

(b) The guarantee shall cease to be 
effective with respect to any guaran-
teed loan amount or any guaranteed 
loan portion amount or any guaran-
teed-amount equivalent to the extent 
that: 

(1) The guaranteed loan amount or 
the respective guaranteed loan portion 
amount or the respective guaranteed 
amount equivalent, as the case may be, 
is separated at any time from the 
unguaranteed loan amount or the re-
spective unguaranteed loan portion 
amount or the respective 
unguaranteed-amount equivalent, as 
the case may be, in any way.; or 

(2) Any holder of the guaranteed loan 
note or any guaranteed loan portion 
note, as the case may be, having a 
claim to payments on the guaranteed 
loan receives more than its pro-rata 
percentage of any payment due to such 
holder from payments made under the 
guarantee at any time during the term 
of the guaranteed loan. 

§ 1738.307 Additional policies. 
The Agency shall provide additional 

loan guarantee policies, consistent 
with OMB Circular A–129, in order to 
achieve its mission of promoting 
broadband in rural areas, which shall 
be published, as needed, in the FEDERAL 
REGISTER. 

§ 1738.308 Full faith and credit of the 
United States. 

Loan guarantees made under this 
part are supported by the full faith and 
credit of the United States and are in-
contestable except for fraud or mis-
representation of which the holder had 
actual knowledge at the time it be-
came a holder. 

§§ 1738.309–1738.349 [Reserved] 

§ 1738.350 OMB control number. 
The information collection require-

ments in this part are approved by the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) and assigned OMB control num-
ber 0572–0130. 

PART 1739—BROADBAND GRANT 
PROGRAM 

Subpart A—Community Connect Grant 
Program 

Secs. 
1739.1 Purpose. 
1739.2 Funding availability and application 

dates and submission. 
1739.3 Definitions. 
1739.4–1739.8 [Reserved] 
1739.9 USDA Rural Development State Di-

rector notification. 
1739.10 Eligible applicant. 
1739.11 Eligible Community Connect 

Competetive Grant Project. 
1739.12 Eligible grant purposes. 
1739.13 Ineligible grant purposes 
1739.14 Matching contributions. 
1739.15 Completed application. 
1739.16 Review of grant applications. 
1739.17 Scoring of applications. 
1739.18 Grant documents. 
1739.19 Reporting and oversight require-

ments. 
1739.20 Audit requirements. 
1739.21 OMB control number. 

Subpart B [Reserved] 

AUTHORITY: Title III, Pub. L. 108–199, 118 
Stat. 3. 
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