129 STAT. 2550 PUBLIC LAW 114-113—DEC. 18, 2015

54 USC 320101
note.

land. Such cooperative agreements and contracts may not exceed
10 years, subject to renewal at the discretion of the Secretary.

MASS MARKING OF SALMONIDS

SEC. 110. The United States Fish and Wildlife Service shall,
in carrying out its responsibilities to protect threatened and endan-
gered species of salmon, implement a system of mass marking
of salmonid stocks, intended for harvest, that are released from
federally operated or federally financed hatcheries including but
not limited to fish releases of coho, chinook, and steelhead species.
Marked fish must have a visible mark that can be readily identified
by commercial and recreational fishers.

EXHAUSTION OF ADMINISTRATIVE REVIEW

SEC. 111. Paragraph (1) of section 122(a) of division E of Public
Law 112-74 (125 Stat. 1013) is amended by striking “through
2016,” in the first sentence and inserting “through 2018,”.

WILD LANDS FUNDING PROHIBITION

SEC. 112. None of the funds made available in this Act or
any other Act may be used to implement, administer, or enforce
Secretarial Order No. 3310 issued by the Secretary of the Interior
on December 22, 2010: Provided, That nothing in this section shall
restrict the Secretary’s authorities under sections 201 and 202
of the Federal Land Policy and Management Act of 1976 (43 U.S.C.
1711 and 1712).

BUREAU OF INDIAN EDUCATION OPERATED SCHOOLS

SEC. 113. Section 115(d) of division E of Public Law 112—
74 (25 U.S.C. 2000 note) is amended by striking “2017” and
inserting “2027”.

VOLUNTEERS IN PARKS

SEC. 114. Section 102301(d) of title 54, United States Code,
is amended by striking “$3,500,000” and inserting “$7,000,000”.

CONTRACTS AND AGREEMENTS WITH INDIAN AFFAIRS

SEc. 115. Notwithstanding any other provision of law, during
fiscal year 2016, in carrying out work involving cooperation with
State, local, and tribal governments or any political subdivision
thereof, Indian Affairs may record obligations against accounts
receivable from any such entities, except that total obligations at
the end of the fiscal year shall not exceed total budgetary resources
available at the end of the fiscal year.

HERITAGE AREAS

SEC. 116. (a) Section 157(h)(1) of title I of Public Law 106—
291 (16 U.S.C. 461 note) is amended by striking “$11,000,000”
and inserting “$13,000,000”.

(b) Division II of Public Law 104-333 (16 U.S.C. 461 note)
is amended—



