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INSTRUCTIONS

FOREST SERVICE REPRESENTATIVE

Prior to issuing the permit book:

Fill out permit book cover and stamp the Ranger District
address, telephone number and sale name in the
appropriate place on the Load Permit.

Fill out the FOREST SERVICE RECEIPT and PURCHASER
RECEIPT on back cover of the permit book. Obtain the
Purchaser’s signature on the FOREST SERVICE RECEIPT as
receiving the permit book. Detach both receipts and retain on
file until the permit book is returned.

When the book is returned:

PURCHASER

At time of issue:

Fill in the return date on FOREST SERVICE RECEIPT and
the PURCHASER RECEIPT.

Forest Service Representative shall sign PURCHASER
RECEIPT as receiving the used permit book and issue the
receipt to the Purchaser.

Issue all permits in sequence by permit number.

A Designated individual named in writing shall completely fill
out all permits in ink and remove the area within the circle
for date and time on the Load Permit.

Before leaving the loading area, the truck driver shall sign a
legal signature in ink at the appropriate place on the Woods
Permit.

Before leaving the loading area, detach the Load and
Purchaser Permit from the permit book and staple to the bunk
or wing log at the front of the load on the driver’s side using
construction type staples with 3/8-1/2 inch legs. Staples shall
be placed where you find the word STAPLE on permits.

TRUCKER PERMIT is for Purchaser’s use.

Definitions:

Destination is the location where the truck will be unloaded.

Truck-trailer "mule train" loads shall require a Load and
Purchaser Permit to be attached to each unit.

Product Removal Permit Books shall be returned to the issuing
Ranger District when all Load Permits and Purchaser Permits
have been used, at sale completion, during seasonal shutdown
and upon request by the Forest Service Representative.
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