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Where to File?

Please see our website at www.uscis.gov/I-
765 or visit the USCIS Contact Center at 
www.uscis.gov/contactcenter to connect 
with a USCIS representative for the most 
current information about where to file this 
application.  The USCIS Contact Center 
provides information in English and 
Spanish.  For TTY (deaf or hard of hearing)
call 1-800-767-1833.

If you are requesting an EAD as an initial 
TPS applicant or a TPS beneficiary, see the 
Form I-821 Instructions and the most recent
Federal Register notice regarding a TPS 
designation, re-designation, or extension 
for your country for additional guidance 
and filing location. You can find 
information on countries designated for 
TPS on our website at www.uscis.gov/tps.

[new]

[no change]

Premium Processing

To determine if your requested classification
or category is available for Premium 
Processing, please visit the USCIS website 
at www.uscis.gov/forms/how-do-i-use-
premium-processing-service.  If you are 
requesting Premium Processing Services, 
you must also file Form I-907, Request 
for Premium Processing Service, with the

1

http://www.uscis.gov/contactcenter
http://www.uscis.gov/I-907
http://www.uscis.gov/I-907
http://www.uscis.gov/forms/how-do-i-use-premium-processing-service
http://www.uscis.gov/forms/how-do-i-use-premium-processing-service


filing fee. 
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Address Change

An applicant who is not a U.S. citizen must
notify USCIS of his or her new address 
within 10 days of moving from his or her 
previous residence.  For information on 
filing a change of address, go to the USCIS 
website at www.uscis.gov/addresschange 
or reach out to the USCIS Contact Center at
www.uscis.gov/contactcenter for help.  
The USCIS Contact Center provides 
information in English and Spanish.  For 
TTY (deaf or hard of hearing) call:  1-800-
767-1833.

NOTE:  Do not submit a change of address
request to the USCIS Lockbox facilities 
because the Lockbox does not process 
change of address requests.

[no change]
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