104 STAT. 1388 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

Agricultural
Reconciliation
Act of 1990.

7 USC 1421 note.

AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

Public Law 101-508
101st Congress
An Act

To provide for reconciliation pursuant to section 4 of the concurrent resolution on the
budget for fiscal year 1991.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the
United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

ong‘:;?] Act may be cited as the “Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act
19907,

SEC. 2. TABLE OF TITLES.

Title I. Agriculture and related programs.

Title II. Banking, housing, and related programs.

Title III. Student loans and labor provisions.

Title IV. Medicare, medicaid, and other health-related programs.
Title V. Income security, human resources, and related programs.
Title VI. Energy and environmental programs.

Title VIL Civil service and postal service programs.

Title VIII. Veterans' programs.

Title IX. Transportation.

Title X. Miscellaneous user fees and other provisions.

Title XI. Revenue provisions.

Title XII. Pensions.

Title XIII. Budget enforcement.

TITLE I—AGRICULTURE AND RELATED
PROGRAMS

SEC. 1001. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) Suort TrrLE.—This title may be cited as the “Agricultural
Reconciliation Act of 1990”.
" 1(Ib] TABLE oF CoNTENTS.—The table of contents of this title is as
ollows:

Sec. 1001. Short title; table of contents.

Subtitle A—Commodity Programs

1101. Triple base for deficiency payments.

1102. Calculation of deficiency payments based on 12-month average.
1103. Acreage reduction program for 1991 crop.

1104. Acreage reduction programs for 1992 through 1995 crops.

1105. Loan origination fees and other savings.

Subtitle B—Other Agricultural Programs

1201, Authorization levels for rural electric and telephone loans.
1202. Authorization levels for FmHA loans.

1203. APHIS inspection user fee on international passengers.
1204. Additional savings and other provisions.

Subtitle C—Effective Date

1301. Effective date.
1302. Readjustment of support levels.

£8 gREY  EEEEY

ENROLLMENT ERRATA

Pursuant to the provisions of H.J. Res. 682, waiving certain enrollment require-
ments with respect to any reconciliation bill, appropriation bill, or continuing reso-
lution for the remainder of the One Hundred First Congress, and providing for the
subsequent preparation and certification of printed enrollments, this printed enroll-
ment containg corrections in indentation, typeface, and type size and includes foot-
notes identifying obvious errors in spelling or punctuation in the hand enrollment.

*Ngte: For information on the printing of this law and a related Presidential d see the editorial
note at the end.




PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-1

Subtitle A—Commodity Programs

SEC. 1101. TRIPLE BASE FOR DEFICIENCY PAYMENTS.

(a) WHEAT.—Section 107B(c)1XC)ii) of the Agricultural Act of
1949 (as added by section 301 of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation,
and Trade Act of 1990) is amended by striking “100 percent” and
inserting ‘85 percent”’. .

(b) FEED GrRAINS.—Section 105B(c)(1)(C)ii) of the Agricultural Act
of 1949 (as added by section 401 of the Food, Agriculture, Conserva-
tion, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended by striking “100 percent”
and inserting “85 percent”.

(c) UpLanp Corron.—Section 103B(c)(1XCXii) of the Agricultural
Act of 1949 (as added by section 501 of the Food, Agriculture,
Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended by striking “100
percent” and inserting “85 percent”.

(d) Rice.—Section 101B(c)1XC){i) of the Agricultural Act of 1949
(as added by section 601 of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and
Trade Act of 1990) is amended by striking “100 percent” and insert-
ing “85 percent”’.

SEC. 1102. CALCULATION OF DEFICIENCY PAYMENTS BASED ON 12-
MONTH AVERAGE.

(a) WaEAaT.—Clause (ii) of section 107B(c)1)(B) of the Agricultural
Act of 1949 (as added by section 301 of the Food, Agriculture,
Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended to read as follows:

“(ii) PAYMENT RATE OF 1994 AND 1995 CrOPS.—The
payment rate for each of the 1994 and 1995 crops of
wheat shall be the amount by which the established
price for the crop of wheat exceeds the higher of—

“(I) the lesser of—

“(aa) the national weighted average market
price received by producers during the market-
ing year for the crop, as determined by the
Secretary; or

“(bb) the national weighted average market
price received by producers during the first 5
months of the marketing year for the crop, as
determined by the Secretary, plus 10 cents per
bushel; or

‘“(II) the loan level determined for the crop, prior
to any adjustment made under subsection (a)3) for
the marketing year for the crop of wheat.”.

(b) FEED GrAINS.—Clause (ii) of section 105B(c)1)B) of the Agricul-
tural Act of 1949 (as added by section 401 of the Food, Agriculture,
Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended to read as follows:

“(ii)) PAYMENT RATE OF 1994 AND 1995 crops.—The
payment rate for each of the 1994 and 1995 crops of
corn, grain sorghums, oats, and barley shall be the
amount by which the established price for the respec-
tive crop of feed grains exceeds the ]]a:igher of—

“(D) the lesser of—

“(aa) the national weighted average market
price received by producers during the market-
ing year for the crop, as determined by the
Secretary; or

T USC 1445b-3a.

T USC 1444f.

7 USC 1444-2.

7 USC 1441-2.



104 STAT. 1388-2 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

7 USC 1441-2.

7 USC 1445j.

T USC 1445b-3a
note.

T USC 1444f.

‘“(bb) the national weighted average market
price received by producers during the first 5
months of the marketing year for the crop, as
determined by the Secretary, plus 7 cents per
bushel; or
‘YII) the loan level determined for the crop, prior
to any adjustment made under subsection (a)(3) for
the marketmg year for the respective crop of feed
grains.’

(c) Rick. —Clause (1i) of section 101B(c)(1)(B) of the Agricultural Act
of 1949 (as added by section 601 of the Food, Agriculture, Conserva-
tion, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended to read as follows:

“(ii) PAYMENT RATE OF 1994 AND 1995 CROPS.—The
payment rate for each of the 1994 and 1995 crops of rice
shall be the amount by which the established price for
the croP of rice exceeds the higher of—

(I) the lesser of—

‘“(aa) the national average market price re-
ceived by producers during the calendar year
that contains the first 5 months of the market-
ing year for the crop, as determined by the

tary; or

‘“(bb) the national average market price re-
ceived by producers during the first 5 months
of the marketing year for the crop, as deter-
mined by the Secretary, plus an appropriate
amount that is fair and equitable in relation to
wheat and feed grains (as determined by the
Secretary); or

“(I) the loan level determined for the crop.”

(d) ConForMING AMENDMENT.—Section 114(c) of the Agncultural
Act of 1949 (as amended by section 1121(a) of the Food, Agriculture,
Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990 and redesignated by section
1161(a)1) of such Act) by striking “wheat, feed grains, and rice
which payments are calculated on the basis of the national weighted
average market price (or, in the case of rice, the natwnal average
market price) for the marketing year for the cr and inserting

“wheat and feed grains which payments are calcu.ﬁted as provided
in sections 107B(c)1)B)ii), 10‘?!5('&) or 105B(c)(1XB)(i)".

SEC. 1103. ACREAGE REDUCTION PROGRAM FOR 1991 CROP.

, (a) WHEAT.—In the case of the 1991 crop of wheat, the Secretary of
Agriculture shall provide for an acreage limitation program as
described in section 107B(e)X1)(F) of the Agricultural Act of 1949 (as
added by section 301 of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and
Trade Act of 1990).

) FEED GRAINS. —Subgaragraph (F) of section 105B(e)1) of the
Agncultural Act of 1949 (as added by section 401 of the Food,
Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended to
read as follows:

“(F) ACREAGE LIMITATION PROGRAM FOR 1991 CROP.—In
the case of the 1991 crop of corn, the Secretary shall provide
for an acreage limitation program (as described in para-
g;aph (2)) under which the acreage planted to corn for

rvest on a farm would be limited to the corn crop acreage
base for the farm for the crop reduced by not less than 7.5
percent.”,



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-3

SEC. 1104. ACREAGE REDUCTION PROGRAMS FOR 1992 THROUGH 1995 17 USC 1445-3a
CROPS, note.

(a) In GeEnEraL.—Notwithstanding any other provision of law,
except as provided in subsections (b) and (c), the Secretary of Agri-
culture shall announce an acreage limitation program for each of
the 1992 through 1995 crops of—

(1) wheat under which the acreage planted to wheat for
harvest on a farm would be limited to the wheat crop acreage
base for the farm for the crop reduced by—

(A) in the case of the 1992 crop of wheat, not less than 6
percent;

(B) in the case of the 1993 crop of wheat, not less than 5
percent;

(C) in the case of the 1994 crop of wheat, not less than 7
percent; and

(D) in the case of the 1995 crop of wheat, not less than 5
percent; and

(2) corn, grain sorghum, and barley under which the acreage
planted to the respective feed grain for harvest on a farm would
be limited to the respective feed grain crop acreage base for the
farm for the crop reduced by not less than 7%z percent.

(b) Strocks-1o-Use RaTio.—Subsection (a) shall not apply to a crop
if the Secretary estimates for such crop that the stocks-to-use ratio
will be less than—

(1) in the case of wheat, 34 percent; and

(2) in the case of corn, grain sorghum, and barley, 20 percent.

(c) TErmINATION.—If the Secretary determines that the quantity
of soybeans on hand in the United States on the first day of the
marketing year for the 1991 crop of soybeans (not including any
quantity of soybeans of the 1991 crop) will be less than 325,000,000 -
bushels, subsection (a) shall not apply to any of the 1992 through
1995 crops of wheat and feed grains.

SEC. 1105. LOAN ORIGINATION FEES AND OTHER SAVINGS.

(a) Omseeps.—Section 205 of the Agricultural Act of 1949 (as 7 USC 1446f.
added by section 701(2) of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and
Trade Act of 1990) is amended—

(1) by redesignating subsection (m) as subsection (n); and

(2) by inserting after subsection (1) the following new subsec-
tion:

“(m) LoaN OriGINATION FEE.—

“(1) Loans.—The Secretary shall charge a producer a loan
origination fee for a crop of oilseeds, in connection with making
a loan, equal to the product obtained by multiplying—

“(A) the loan level determined for the crop under subsec-
tion (c); by

“(B) 2 percent; by

“(C) the quantity of oilseeds for which the producer ob-
tains the loan.

“(2) LoaN peFICIENCY PAYMENTS.—The Secretary shall deduct,
from the amount of any loan deficiency payment made under
subsection (e), an amount equal to the amount of the loan
origination fee that would otherwise be paid under paragraph
(1) if the producer obtained a loan ratﬂer a loan deficiency
payment.”.

(b) PEANUTS.—



104 STAT. 1388-4 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

7 USC 1445c-3. (1) In GENERAL.—Section 108B of the Agricultural Act of 1949
(as added by section 806 of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation,
and Trade Act of 1990) is amended—

(A) by redesignating subsection (g) as subsection (h); and

(B) by inserting after subsection (f) the following new
subsection:

‘(g) MARKETING ASSESSMENT.—

“(1) IN geNErAL.—The Secretary shall provide, by regulation,
for a nonrefundable marketing assessment applicable to each of
the 1991 through 1995 crops of peanuts. The assessment shall be
made in accordance with this subsection and shall be on a per
pound basis in an amount equal to 1 percent of the national
average quota or additional peanut support rate per pound, as
applicable, for the applicable crop. No peanuts shall be assessed
more than 1 percent of the applicable support rate under this
subsection.

*(2) FIRST PURCHASERS.—

“(A) In GeNErAL.—Except as provided under paragraphs
(3) and (4), the first purchaser of peanuts shall—

“(i) collect from the producer a marketing assessment
equal to % percent of the applicable national average
support rate times the quantity of peanuts acquired;

“(ii) pay, in addition to the amount collected under
clause (i), a marketing assessment in an amount equal
to Y% percent of the applicable national average support
rate times the quantity of peanuts acquired; and

“(iii) remit the amounts required under clauses (i)
and (ii) to the Commodity Credit Corporation in a
manner specified by the Secretary.

“(B) DerintTiON.—For purposes of this subsection, the
term ‘first purchaser’ means a person acquiring peanuts
from a producer except that in the case of peanuts forfeited
by a producer to the Commodity Credit Corporation, such
term means the person acquiring the peanuts from the
Commodity Credit Corporation.

“(3) OTHER PRIVATE MARKETINGS.—In the case of a private
marketing by a producer directly to a consumer through a retail
or wholesale outlet or in the case of a marketing by the pro-
ducer outside of the continental United States, the producer
shall be responsible for the full amount of the assessment and
shall remit the assessment by such time as is specified by the
Secretary.

“(4) Loan pEaNUTS.—In the case of peanuts that are pledged
as collateral for a price support loan made under this section, %
of the assessment shall be deducted from the proceeds of the
loan. The remainder of the assessment shall be paid by the first
purchaser of the peanuts. For purposes of computing net gains
on peanuts under this section, the reduction in loan proceeds
shall be treated as having been paid to the producer.

‘5) PenALTIES.—If any person fails to collect or remit the
reduction required by this subsection or fails to comply with
such requirements for recordkeeping or otherwise as are re-
quired by the Secretary to carry out this subsection, the person
shall be liable to the Secretary for a civil penalty up to an
amount determined by multiplying—

“(A) the quantity of peanuts involved in the violation; by



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-5

“(B) the national average quota peanut price support
level for the applicable crop year.

“(6) ENFORCEMENT.—The Secretary may enforce this subsec-
tion in the courts of the United States.”.

(2) ConFOoRMING AMENDMENT.—Section 108B(a)2) of the Agri-
cultural Act of 1949 (as added by section 806(3) of the Food, 7 USC 1445c-3.
Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended
by inserting after “cost of land” the following: “and the cost of
any assessments required under subsection (g)".

(c) SucAar.—Section of the Agricultural Act of 1949 (as added 7 USC 1446g.
by section 901(2) of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade
Act of 1990) is amended—

(1) by redesignating subsection (i) as subsection (j); and

(2) by inserting after subsection (h) the following new sub-

. section:

“(i) MARKETING ASSESSMENT.—

(1) Sucarcane.—Effective only for each of the 1991 through
1995 crops of sugarcane, the first processor of sugarcane shall
remit to the Commodity Credit (,‘Erporation a nonrefundable
marketing assessment in an amount equal to .18 cents per
pound of raw cane sugar processed by the processor from domes-
ticall é)roduced sugarcane.

“{2{ UGAR BEETS.—Effective only for each of the 1991 through
1995 crops of sugar beets, the first processor of sugar beets shall
remit to the Commeodity Credit &rporation a nonrefundable .
marketing assessment in an amount equal to .193 cents per
pound of beet sugar processed by the processor from domesti-
cally produced sugar beets.

“(3) CoLLECTION.—Marketing assessments required under this
subsection shall be collected and remitted to the Commodity
Credit Corporation in the manner prescribed by the Secretary
and shall be nonrefundable.

“(4) PenavTies.—If any person fails to collect or remit the
reduction required by this subsection or fails to comply with
such requirements for recordkeeping or otherwise as are re-
quired by the Secretary to carry out this subsection, the person
shall be liable to the Secretary for a civil penalty up to an
amount determined by multiplying—

“(A) the quantity of cane sugar or beet sugar involved in
the violation; by

“(B) the support level for the applicable crop of sugarcane
or sugar beets.

“(5) EnrorceMENT.—The Secretary may enforce this subsec-
tion in the courts of the United States.”.

(d) Honey.—Section 207 of the Agricultural Act of 1949 (as added 7 USC 1446h.
by section 1001 of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade
Act of 1990) is amended—

(1) by redesignating subsection (i) as subsection (j); and
sec(:%? by inserting after subsection (h) the following new sub-

ion:

‘(i) MARKETING ASSESSMENT.—

“(1) In cenErAL.—Effective only for each of the 1991 through
1995 crops of honey, producers and producer-packers of honey
(as defined in paragraphs (5) and (9), respectively, of section 3 of
the Honey Research, Promotion, and Consumer Information
Act (7T U.S.C. 4602)) shall remit to the Commodity Credit Cor-
poration a nonrefundable marketing assessment on a per pound



104 STAT. 1388-6 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

7 USC 1446e.

basis in an amount equal to 1 percent of the national price
support level for each such crop as otherwise provided in this
section.

“(2) CorrectioN.—The assessment shall be collected and
remitted by the first handler of honey in the manner prescribed
by the Secretary which, to the extent practicable, shall be as
provided for in the Honey Research, Promotion, and Consumer
Information Act.

“(8) ExEmpriOoNs.—All persons who are exempt from the
payment of the assessment authorized by such Act, and all
imported honey, shall be exempt from the payment of the
assessment required by this subsection.

“(4) PenavTies.—If any person fails to collect or remit the
reduction required by this subsection or fails to comply with
such requirements for recordkeeping or otherwise as are re-
qll:u-ed by the Secretary to carry out this subsection, the person

all be liable to the Secretary for a civil penalty up to an
amount determined by multiplying—

“(A) the quantity of honey involved in the violation; by
“(B) the support level for the applicable crop of honey.

“(5) ENForcEMENT.—The Secretary ,may enforce this subsec-
tion in the courts of the United States.”

(e) WooL AND MoHAIR.—Section 704 of the National Wool Act of
1954 (7T U.S.C. 1783) (as amended by section 201(b) of the Food,

iculture, Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended by
adding at the following new subsection:

“(c) MARKETING AssessMENTS.—Effective only for each of the 1991
through 1995 marketing years for wool and mohair, the Secretary
shall deduct an amount from the payment to be made available to
producers of wool and mohair under subsection (a) equal to 1 percent
of the payment.”.

(f) ToBacco.—Section 106 of the Agricultural Act of 1949 (7 U.S.C.
1445) is amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:

“(gX1) Effective only for each of the 1991 through 1995 crops of
tobacco for which price support is made available under this Act,
producers and purchasers of such tobacco shall each remit to the
Commodity Credit Corporation a nonrefundable marketing assess-
ment in an amount equal to .5 percent of the national price support
level for each such crop as otherwise provided for in this section.

“(2) Such producer assessments and purchaser assessments shall

“(A) collected in the same manner as dprovided for in section
106A(d)2) or 106B(d)(3), as applicable; an
“(B) enforced in the same manner as provided in section
106A(h) or 106B(j), as applicable.

“(3) The Secretary may enforce this subsection in the courts of the
United States.”

(g) OTHER Savings.—Section 204 of the Agricultural Act of 1949
(as added by section 101 of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and
Trade Act of 1990) is amended—

(1) in subsection (g)—
(A) in paragraph (1), by striking “1991 through 1994"” and
inserting “1992 through 1995”;
(B) in the matter preceding subparagraph (A) of para-
graph (2)—
(i) by inserting after “purchases” the following: “in
the following calendar year”’; and



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-7

(ii) by inserting after “producers” the following: “in
such following calendar year”’; and
(C) in paragraph (2)B), by striking “that calendar year”
and inserting “‘such following calendar year”’;

(2) by redesignating subsections (h) and (i) as subsections (j)
and (k), respectively; and

(3) by inserting after subsection (g) the following new subsec-
tions:

“(h) RepucTioN 1IN PriCE RECEIVED.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Beginning January 1, 1991, the Secretary
shall provide for a reduction in the price received by producers
for all milk produced in the United States and marketed by
producers for commercial use, in addition to any reduction in
price required under subsection (g).

“(2) AMouNT.—The amount of the reduction under paragraph
(1) in the price received by producers shall be—

“(A) during calendar year 1991, 5 cents per hundred-
weight of milk marketed; and

“(B) during each of the calendar years 1992 through 1995,
11.25 cents per hundredweight of milk marketed, which
rate shall be adjusted on or before May 1 of each of the
calendar years 1992 through 1995 by an amount per
hundredweight that is necessary to compensate for refunds
made under paragraph (3) on the basis of marketings in the
previous calendar year.

“(3) Rerunp.—The Secretary shall provide a refund of the
entire reduction under paragraph (2) in the price of milk re-
ceived by a producer during a calendar year, if the producer
provides evidence that the producer did not increase marketings
in the calendar year that such reduction was in effect when
compared to the immediately preceding calendar year.

“(i) ENFORCEMENT.—

“(1) CoLLECcTION.—Reductions in price required under subsec-
tion (g) or (h) shall be collected and remitted to the Commodity
Credit Corporation in the manner prescribed by the Secretary.

“(2) PenavTies.—If any person fails to collect or remit the
reduction required by subsection (g) or (h) or fails to comply
with such requirements for recordkeeping or otherwise as are
required by the Secretary to carry out such subsection, the
person shall be liable to the Secretary for a civil penalty up to
an amount determined by multiplying—

“(A) the quantity of milk involved in the violation; by
i‘]‘.(l’:B) the support rate for the applicable calendar year for
milk.

“(3) EnForcEMENT.—The Secretary may enforce subsection (g)
or (h) in the courts of the United States.”.

Subtitle B—Other Agricultural Programs

SEC. 1201. AUTHORIZATION LEVELS FOR RURAL ELECTRIC AND TELE-
PHONE LOANS.

Title III of the Rural Electrification Act of 1936 (7 U.S.C. 931 et
seq.) is amended by adding at the end the following new section:



104 STAT. 1388-8

PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

7 USC 940d. “SEC. 314. AUTHORIZATION LEVELS FOR RURAL ELECTRIC AND TELE-

PHONE LOANS.

“(a) INn GENERAL.—Subject to the other provisions of this section
and notwithstanding any other provision of law, for each of fiscal
years 1991 through 1995, insured loans may be made in accordance
with this title from the Rural Electrification and Telephone Revolv-
ing Fund established under section 301 in amounts equal to the
following levels:

(1) For fiscal year 1991, $896,000,000.
“(2) For fiscal year 1992, $932,000,000.
“(3) For fiscal year 1993, $969,000,000.
“(4) For fiscal year 1994, $1,008,000,000.
“(b) For fiscal year 1995, $1,048,000,000.

“(b) RepucTtioN.—Notwithstanding any other provision of law, for
each of fiscal years 1991 through 1995, the Administrator shall—

“(1) reduce the amounts otherwise made available for insured
loans made from the Rural Electrification and Telephone
Revolving Fund by—

“(A) $224,000,000 for fiscal year 1991;
“(B) $234,000,000 for fiscal year 1992;
“(C) $244,000,000 for fiscal year 1993;
“(D) $256,000,000 for fiscal year 1994; and
“(E) $267,000,000 for fiscal year 1995; and

“(2) use the funds made available from such reductions in

each fiscal year to guarantee loans under subsection (d).

“(c) ManpaTORY LEVELS.—Notwithstanding any other provision of
law, the Administrator shall make insured loans at the levels
authorized by this section for each of fiscal years 1991 through 1995
taking into account any reductions under subsection (b).

“(d) GUARANTEED LOANS—

“(1) In cENERAL—Except as otherwise provided in this
subsection and subsection (e) and notwithstanding any other
provision of law, in carrying out this Act, the Administrator
shall guarantee loans made by legally organized lending agen-
cies to the extent of the reduction in insured loans as provided
in subsection (b).

“(2) AMOUNT OF GUARANTEE.—The guarantees authorized
under paragraph (1) shall be 90 percent of the principal of and
interest on the loan and shall be made only upon the request of
the borrower.

“(3) No FEDERAL INSTRUMENTALITY.—The Administrator may
not provide any such guarantee for a loan made by the Federal
Financing Bank, the Rural Telephone Bank, or any other lend-
ing agency that is an agency or instrumentality of the United
States other than banks for cooperatives.

“(4) AutHorITY.—The Administrator is authorized to approve
such guarantees subject to full use being made during each
fiscal year of insured loan amounts made available during the
fiscal year.

“(5) ConstruUCTION.—Nothing in this subsection shall be con-
strued as modifying the authority provided in section 306.

*(e) IMPLEMENTATION.—

‘(1) IN GENERAL—The Administrator shall implement the
reduction in insured loans provided by subsection (b) in a
manner that will lessen its adverse effect.



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-9

“(2) ALLOCATION BETWEEN ELECTRIC AND TELEPHONE PRO-
GRAMS.—The reductions required by subsection (b) shall be
allocated between the electric and telephone programs for each
fiscal year in proportion to the amount of insured funds made
availagle for each such program during the fiscal year in
annual appropriations Acts.

“(3) ELECTRIC BORROWER'S OPTION.—If the amount of an
insured electric loan is reduced as a result of the require-
ments of subsection (b), the electric borrower may, at the
option of such borrower, obtain capital to replace the amount
of the reduction—

“(A) with the assistance of a loan guarantee (as provided
by subsection (d));

“(B) from internally generated funds of the electric bor-
rower;

““C) from e({)rivate credit sources with a lien accommoda-
tion provided by the Administrator; or

“(D) from other private sources.”.

SEC. 1202. AUTHORIZATION LEVELS FOR FmHA LOANS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (b) of section 346 of the Consolidated
Farm and Rural Development Act (7 U.S.C. 1994(b)) is amended to
read as follows:

“(bX1) For each of the fiscal years 1991 through 1995, real estate
and operating loans may be insured, made to be sold and insured, or
guaranteed in accordance with subtitles A and B, respectively, from
the Agricultural Credit Insurance Fund established under section
309 in amounts equal to the following levels:

“(A) For fiscal year 1991, $4,175,000,000, of which not less
than $827,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans under
subtitle A.

“(B) For fiscal year 1992, $4,343,000,000, of which not less
than $861,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans under
subtitle A.

“(C) For fiscal year 1993, $4,516,000,000, of which not less than
$895,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans under subtitle A.

“(D) For fiscal year 1994, $4,69’?,008.000, of which not less
than $931,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans under
subtitle A.

‘“(E) For fiscal year 1995, $4,885,000,000, of which not less
than $968,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans under
subtitle A.

“(2) Subject to paragraph (3), such amounts set forth in paragraph
(1) shall be apportioned as follows:

“(A) For fiscal year 1991—

“(i) $1,019,000,000 for insured loans, of which not less
than $83,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans; and

“(ii) $3,156,000,000 for guaranteed loans, of which not less
{.han $744,000,000 shall be for guarantees of farm ownership
oans.

“(B) For fiscal year 1992—

‘(1) $1,060,000,000 for insured loans, of which not less
than $87,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans; and

“(1i) $3,283,000,000 for guaranteed loans, of which not less
{.han $774,000,000 shall be for guarantees of farm ownership
oans.

“(C) For fiscal year 1993—

89-1940-91-14:QL 3 Part 2



104 STAT. 1388-10 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

“(i) $1,102,000,000 for insured loans, of which not less
than $90,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans; and

“(ii) $3,414,000,000 for guaranteed loans, of which not less
fhan $805,000,000 shall be for guarantees of farm ownership
oans.

“(D) For fiscal year 1994—

“(i) $1,147,000,000 for insured loans, of which not less
than $94,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans; and

“(ii) $3,650,000,000 for guaranteed loans, of which not less
{,han $837,000,000 shall be for guarantees of farm ownership
oans.

“(E) For fiscal year 1995—

“(i) $1,192,000,000 for insured loans, of which not less
than $97,000,000 shall be for farm ownership loans; and
“(ii) $3,693,000,000 for guaranteed loans, of which not less
ithan $871,000,000 shall be for guarantees of farm ownership -
oans.
“(3) Notwithstanding any other provision of law:
“(A) The Secretary shall—
“(i) reduce the amounts otherwise made available for
insured loans by—
“(I) $482,000,000, for fiscal year 1991;
“(11) $614,000,000, for fiscal year 1992;
“(I11) $760,000,000, for fiscal year 1993;
“(IV) $859,000,000, for fiscal year 1994; and
“(V) $907,000,000, for fiscal year 1995; and
“(ii) use the funds made available from such reductions in
each fiscal year to guarantee loans under section 351.

“(B) The total amount of insured loans shall bear the same
ratio to the amount of insured farm ownership loans as the
dollar amount specified in paragraph (2)(A)i) for insured loans
bears to the dollar amount specified therein for insured farm
ownership loans.

“C) If more than 70 percent of the number of loans guaran-
teed under section 351 in a fiscal year have been guaranteed to
persons to whom the Secretary had not previously made an
insured loan under this Act, in lieu of the dollar amounts
specified in subparagraph (A) for the immediately succeeding
fiscal year, the dollar amounts which shall apply shall each be
the product obtained by multiplying—

“(i) such dollar amount; by
“(ii) the quotient of—
“(I) the number of persons provided with guaranteed
loans under section 351 in the fiscal year to whom the
Secretary had not previously made an insured or a
guaranteed loan under this Act; divided by
‘T the total number of persons provided with
guaranteed loans under section 351 in the fiscal year.
“(4) Notwithstanding subsection (a), the Secretary shall, as soon as
practicable after the date of enactment of this subsection, make,
insure, or guarantee loans at the levels authorized by this subsection
for each of the fiscal years 1991 through 1995.”.
(b) INTEREST RATE REDUCTION PROGRAM.—

(1) INn GENERAL.—Section 351 of such Act (7 U.S.C. 1999) is
amended—

(A) in subsection (c)—



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-11

(i) by striking “50 percent” and inserting “100 per-

cent”’; and
(ii) by striking “2 percent” and inserting “4 percent”;
and
(B) in subsection (d), by striking “, or 3 years, whichever
is less”.

(2) EXTENSION OF PROGRAM FOR 2 YEARS.—Section 1320 of the
Food Security Act of 1985 (7 U.S.C. 1999 note) is amended by
striking “1993"” and inserting “1995”.
(c) DEMONSTRATION PROJECT FOR PURCHASE OF SysTEM LAND.—
Section 351(h)X1) of such Act (T U.S.C. 1999(h)1)) is amended by
striking ‘“3-year” and inserting “4-year”.

SEC. 1203. APHIS INSPECTION USER FEE ON INTERNATIONAL PAS-
SENGERS.

Section 2509(a) of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade
Act of 1990 is amended— 21 USC 136a.
(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “a commercial vessel,
commercial aircraft, commercial truck, or railroad car,” and
inserting “an international passenger, commercial vessel,
commercial aircraft, commercial truck, or railroad car.”; and
(2) in paragraph (3)(B)—

(A) by adding at the end of clause (ii) the following: “Any
such reimbursement shall be subject to appropriations
under clause (v).”’; and

(B) b‘y adding at the end the following new clause:

‘(v) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There are
authorized to be appropriated each fiscal year amounts
in the Fund for use for quarantine or inspection
services.”.

SEC. 1204. ADDITIONAL SAVINGS AND OTHER PROVISIONS.

(a) INTEGRATED FARM MANAGEMENT PrOGRAM.—Section 1451 of
the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990 is 7 USC 5822.
amended—
(1) in subsection (d), by striking “enroll not more than” and
inserting “enroll not less than’’; and
(2) in subsection (hXTXA), by striking “shall not be eligible”
and inserting “shall be eligible”.
(b) Foon Am Assistance.—The Agricultural Trade, Development,
and Assistance Act of 1954 (as amended by section 1512 of the Food,
Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990) is amended—
(1) in section 202(e)1), by striking “private” and all that T7USC 1722
follows through “Administrator” and inserting “the Adminis-
trator, not less than $10,000,000, and not more than $13,500,000,
shall'be made available in each fiscal year to private voluntary
organizations and cooperatives’’;
(2) in section 406, by adding at the end the following new 7 USC 1736.
subsection:
“(d) AvamLasiLity oF Funps.—Funds shall be available under this
Acctl only to the extent provided in advance in appropriation Acts.”;
an
(3) in section 407(cX4), by striking “providing ocean” and 7 USC 1736a.
inserting “providing ocean transportation or”.
(c) ToBacco PRoGRAM ADJUSTMENT.—Section 213 of the Dairy and
Tobacco Adjustment Act of 1983 (7 U.S.C. 511r) is amended—



104 STAT. 1388-12 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

7 USC 1421 note.

T USC 136w
note.

7 USC 511r note.

T USC 1421 note.

(1) in subsection (d), by inserting before the period the follow-
ing: “, subsection (e), and subsection (f)’’; and

(2) in subsection (f), by adding at the end the following new
paragraph:

“(4) Subsection (d) shall apply with respect to fees and charges
imposed to cover the costs of such end user identification, certifi-
cation, and reporting activities.”.

(d) EMERGENCY Loans.—Section 2269 of the Food, Agriculture,
Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990 is amended by—

(1) striking “(7 U.S.C. 1981(b))” and inserting ‘(7 U.S.C.
1961(b))”’; and
(2) striking “1988"” and inserting ““1990".

(e) FIFRA User FEees.—Notwithstanding any provision of the
Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act of 1990, nothing in this title or
the other provisions of this Act shall be construed to require or
authorize the Administrator of the Environmental Protection
Agency to assess or collect any fees or charges for services and
activities authorized under the Federal Insecticide, Fungicide, and
Rodenticide Act (7 U.S.C. 136 et seq.).

Subtitle C—Effective Date

SEC. 1301. EFFECTIVE DATE.

This title and the amendments made by this title shall become
effective 1 day after the date of enactment of the Food, Agriculture,
Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990, or December 1, 1990, which-
ever is earlier.

SEC. 1302. READJUSTMENT OF SUPPORT LEVELS.

(a) FAiLUure 1o ENTER INTO AGREEMENT.—If by June 30, 1992, the
United States does not enter into (within the context of section
1102(a) of the Omnibus Trade and Competitiveness Act of 1988 (19
US.C. 2902)) an agricultural trade agreement in the Uruguay
Round of multilateral trade negotiations under the General Agree-
ment on Tariffs and Trade (GATT), agricultural acreage limitation
and price support and production adjustment programs and export
promotion levels shall be reconsidered and adjusted by the Secretary
of Agriculture (hereafter in this section referred to as the “Sec-
retary”) in accordance with subsection (b), as appropriate to protect
the interests of American agricultural producers and ensure the
international competitiveness of United States agriculture.

(b) ReQUIRED MEAsURES.—Pursuant to subsection (a), in order to
protect the interests of American agricultural producers and en-
sst;rce the competitive position of United States agriculture, the

retary—

(1) is authorized to waive any minimum level for any acreage
limitation program required or authorized for any of the 1993
through 1995 crops of wheat, feed grains, upland cotton, or rice
established under section 107B(e), 105B(e), 103B(e), or 101B(e) of
the Agricultural Act of 1949 (as amended by sections 301, 401,
501, and 601 of the Food, Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade
Act of 1990), respectively;

(2) shall.increase by $1,000,000,000 for the period inning
October 1, 1993, and ending September 30, 1995, the level of
export promotion programs authorized under the Agricultural
Trade Act of 1978 (as amended by section 1531 of the Food,



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-13

Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade Act of 1990), in addition
to any amounts otherwise required or made available under
such programs; and

(3) shall permit producers to repay price support loans for any
of the 1993 through 1995 crops of wheat and feed grains at the
levels provided under sections 107B(a)(4) and 105B(a)4) of the
Agricultural Act of 1949, respectively.

(c) FAILURE oF AGREEMENT TO ENTER INTO FOrRCE.—If by June 30,
1993, an agricultural trade agreement under the Uruguay Round of
multilateral trade negotiations under the General Agreement on
Tariffs and Trade has not entered into force for the United States,
agricultural price support and other programs and export promotion
levels shall be reconsidered and adjusted by the Secretary in accord-
ance with subsection (d), if the Secretary determines such action is
appropriate to protect the interests of American agricultural
producers and ensure the international competitiveness of United
States agriculture.

(d) SpecIFic MEASURES.—

(1) MEASURES TO BE CONSIDERED.—Pursuant to subsection (c),
the Secretary shall consider—

(A) waiving all or part of the requirements of this title,
and the amendments made by this title, requiring reduc-
tions in agricultural spending;

(B) increasing the level of funds made available for the
programs authorized under the Agricultural Trade Act of
1978; and

(C) permitting producers to repay price support loans for
any of the 1993 through 1995 crops of wheat and feed grains
at the levels provided under sections 107B(a)X4) and
105B(a)4) of the Agricultural Act of 1949, respectively.

(2) AurHorrry.—The Secretary is authorized to implement
the measures specified in subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C) of
paragraph (1). This authority shall be in addition to, and not in
place of, any other authority under any other provision of law.

(3) ImPLEMENTATION.—If the Secretary determines the action
is appropriate pursuant to subsection (c), the Secretary shall
implement measures specified in subparagraph (A) of para-
graph (1) and either or both of the measures specified in
subparagraph (B) or (C) of paragraph (1).

(e) LimiraTioN.—This section shall not be construed to authorize
the Secretary to reduce the level of income support provided to
agricultural producers in the United States.

(f) TerminaTION.—The provisions of subsections (a) and (b) shall
cease to be effective if the President certifies to Congress that the
failure referred to in subsection (a) to enter into an agricultural
trade agreement in the Uruguay Round of multilateral trade nego-
tiations under the GATT is a result in whole or in part of the
provisions of section 151 of the Trade Act of 1974 (19 U.S.C. 2191), or
essentially similar provisions, not applying or in effect not applying
during the period ending May 31, 1991 (or during the period June 1,
1991, through May 31, 1993, if the condition of section 1103(b)(1XB)i)
is satisfied) to implementing bills submitted with res to such an
agreement entered into during the applicable period under section
{11%283} 23!65{1%(;)0!:11111:118 Trade and Competitiveness Act of 1988 (19



104 STAT. 1388-14

12 USC 1811
note.

£ £F & HELEEE ¥ EF BX

2001.
2002.

2003,
2004.

. FDIC authorized to borrow from Federal Financing Bank.

2101.
2102.
2103. M
2104.
2105.
21086,

2201.

2301.
2302,

2401.

PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

TITLE II—BANKING, HOUSING, AND RELATED PROGRAMS

Subtitle A—Federal Deposit Insurance Assessments

Short title.

FDIC authorized to increase assessment rates as necessary to protect in-
surance funds.

FDIC authorized to make mid-year adjustments in assessment rates.

FDIC authorized to set designated reserve ratio as necessary in face of
significant risk of substantial losses to insurance fund.

Subtitle B—FHA Mortgage Insurance
Increase in mortgage limit.
Mortgagor equity.
ortgage insurance premiums.
Mutual mortgxge insurance fund distributions.
Actuarial soundness of mutual mortgage insurance fund.
Home equity conversion mortgage insurance demonstration.

Subtitle C—Auction of Federally Insured Mortgages
Auction of multifamily mortgages.
Subtitle D—Crime and Flood Insurance Programs

Crime insurance program.
Flood insurance program.

Subtitle E—Effective Date
Effective date.

TITLE II—BANKING, HOUSING, AND

RELATED PROGRAMS

Subtitle A—Federal Deposit Insurance

Assessments

SEC. 2001. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “FDIC Assessment Rate Act of 1990".
SEC. 2002. FDIC AUTHORIZED TO INCREASE ASSESSMENT RATES AS NEC-

ESSARY TO PROTECT INSURANCE FUNDS.

(a) BANk Insurance Funp.—Section 7(b)X1)C) of the Federal De-
posit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(b)X1)XC)) is amended to read as

follows:

“(C) ASSESSMENT RATE FOR BANK INSURANCE FUND MEMBERS.—

“() In GENERAL.—The assessment rate for Bank Insur-
ance Fund members shall be the greater of 0.15 percent or
such rate as the Board of Directors, in its sole discretion,
determines to be appropriate—

“(I) to maintain the reserve ratio at the designated
reserve ratio; or

“(II) if the reserve ratio is less than the designated
reserve ratio, to increase the reserve ratio to the des-
ignated reserve ratio within a reasonable period of
time.

“(ii) FAcTors T0 BE CONSIDERED.—In making any deter-
mination under clause (i), the Board of Directors shall
consider the Bank Insurance Fund's expected operating
expenses, case resolution expenditures, and income, the
effect of the assessment rate on members’ earnings and



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-15

capital, and such other factors as the Board of Directors
may deem appropriate.

“(iii) MiNiMUM AsSESSMENT.—Notwithstanding clause (i),
the assessment shall not be less than $1,000 for each
member in each year.”.

(b) SavinGs AssocIATION INSURANCE Funp.—Section T(bX1XD) of
the Federal Deposit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(b)(1)D)) is amend-
ed to read as follows:

‘D) ASSESSMENT RATE FOR SAVINGS ASSOCIATION INSURANCE
FUND MEMBERS.—

“G) IN GENERAL—The assessment rate for Savings
Association Insurance Fund members shall be the greater
of 0.15 percent or such rate as the Board of Directors, in its
sole discretion, determines to be appropriate—

‘() to maintain the reserve ratio at the designated
reserve ratio; or

“(II) if the reserve ratio is less than the designated
reserve ratio, to increase the reserve ratio to the des-
ignated reserve ratio within a reasonable period of
time.

“(ii) FACTORS TO BE CONSIDERED.—In making any deter-
mination under clause (i), the Board of Directors shall
consider the Savings Association Insurance Fund’s expected
operating expenses, case resolution expenditures, and
income, the effect of the assessment rate on members’
earnings and capital, and such other factors as the Board of
Directors may deem appropriate.

““(iii) MiNIMUM AssESSMENT.—Notwithstanding clause (i),
the assessment shall not be less than $1, for each
member in each year.

“(iv) TransiTioN RULE.—Until December 31, 1997, the
assessment rate for Savings Association Insurance Fund
members shall not be less than the followi.ng:

‘) From January 1, 1990, through December 31,
1990, 0.208 percent.

“(II) From January 1, 1991, through December 31,
1993, 0.23 percent.

‘“(II1) From January 1, 1994, through December 31,
1997, 0.18 percent.”.

(c) CLERICAL AMENDMENTS REFLECTING $1,000 MINIMUM ASSESS-
MENT Provisions oF CURRENT Law.—Section T(b)2)XA) of the Fed-
eral Deposit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(b)2)(A)) is amended—

(1) by inserting “or subparagraph (C)(iii) or (D)Xiii) of subsec-
tion (bX1)” after “subsection (c)2)"’; and

(2) in clauses (i) and (ii), by inserting “the greater of $500 or
an amount” before “equal to the product of”.

SEC. 2003. FDIC AUTHORIZED TO MAKE MID-YEAR ADJUSTMENTS IN
ASSESSMENT RATES.

(a) AssessMENT RaTes.—Section 7(b)1XA) of the Federal Deposit
Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(b)(1XA)) is amended to read as follows:
“(A) ASSESSMENT RATES PRESCRIBED.—

“(i) AUTHORITY TO SET RATES.—Subject to clause (iii), the
Corporation shall set assessment rates for insured deposi-
tory institutions at such times as the Corporation, in its sole
discretion, determines to be appropriate.



104 STAT. 1388-16 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

“(ii) RATE FOR EACH FUND TO BE SET INDEPENDENTLY.—The
Corporation shall fix the assessment rate of Bank Insur-
ance Fund members independently from the assessment
rate for Savings Association Insurance Fund members.

“(iii) DEADLINE FOR ANNOUNCING RATE CHANGES.—The
Cogration shall announce any change in assessment
rates.—

“(I) for the semiannual period beginning on January
1 and ending on June 30, not later than the preceding
November 1; and

“(IT) for the semiannual period beginning on July 1
and ending on December 31, not later than the preced-

ing May 1.”.

(b) ASSESSMENT I?';tocmnunm.—Section TbX2XA) of the Federal
Deposit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(b)(2XA)), as amended by sec-
tion 2(c) of this Act, is amended—

(1) by striking “annual” each time it appears;

(2) in clause (iXI), by inserting “during that semiannual
period” after “member”’; and

(3) in clause (ii)I), by inserting ‘“during that semiannual
period” after “member”.

(c) CoNFORMING AMENDMENT ON TIMING OF AsSSESSMENT CRED-
1rs.—Section T(d)(1XA) of the Federal Deposit Insurance Act (12
U.S.C. 1817(dX1XA)) is amended to read as follows:

“(A) The Corporation shall prescribe and publish the aggre-
gate amount to be credited to insured depository institutions—

“(i) in the semiannual period beginning on Jan 1 and
le;gdilng 051 June 30, not later than the preceding Novem-
r 1; an

“(ii) in the semiannual period beginning on July 1 and
ie\&‘n;iing on December 31, not later than the preceding
y l-ll.

SEC. 2004. FDIC AUTHORIZED TO SET DESIGNATED RESERVE RATIO AS
NECESSARY IN FACE OF SIGNIFICANT RISK OF SUBSTANTIAL
LOSSES TO INSURANCE FUND.

Section 7(b)(1)XB) of the Federal Deposit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C.
1817(b)(1XB)) is amended—
(1) by striking “, not exceeding 1.50 percent,” each time it
appears;
(2) in clause (iii)—
(A) by inserting “and” at the end of subclause (I);
(B) by striking subclauses (II) and (III); and
(C) by redesignating subclause (IV) as subclause (II); and
(3) in clause (iv)—
(A) by inserting “and” at the end of subclause (I);
(B) by striking subclauses (II) and (I1I); and
(C) by redesignating subclause (IV) as subclause (II).

SEC. 2005. FDIC AUTHORIZED TO BORROW FROM FEDERAL FINANCING
BANK.

Section 14 of the Federal Deposit Insurance Act (12 U.S.C. 1824) is
amended—
(1) in the heading, by striking “Sec. 14.” and inserting:
“SEC. 14. BORROWING AUTHORITY.
‘“(a) BorrowING FrROM TREASURY.—";



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-17

(2) in subsection (a), as designated by paragraph (1)—

(A) by striking “this section” each time it appears and
inserting “this subsection”, and ;

(B) by striking “The Corporation may employ such funds”
and inserting “The Corporation may employ any funds
obtained under this section”; and

(3) by adding after subsection (a), as amended by paragraph
(2), the following new subsection:

“(b) BorrowING FroMm FEDERAL FinanciNG Bank.—The Corpora-
tion is authorized to issue and sell the Corporation’s obligations, on
behalf of the Bank Insurance Fund or Savings Association Insur-
ance Fund, to the Federal Financing Bank established by the Fed-
eral Financing Bank Act of 1973. Federal Financing Bank is
authorized to purchase and sell the Corporation’s obligations on
terms and conditions determined by the Federal Financing Bank.
Any such borrowings shall be obligations subject to the obligation
limitation of section 15(c) of this Act. This subsection does not affect
the eligibility of any other entity to borrow from the Federal
Financing Bank.”.

Subtitle B—FHA Mortgage Insurance

SEC. 2101. INCREASE IN MORTGAGE LIMIT.

Section 203(b)2) of the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1709(b)2))
is amended by striking “150 percent (185 percent until October 31,
1990) of the dollar amount specified” and inserting the following:
185 percent of the dollar amount specified”.

SEC. 2102. MORTGAGOR EQUITY.

Section 203(b)2) of the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1709(b)2))
is amendﬁd by adding at the end the following new undesignated
paragraph:

“Notwithstanding any other provision of this paragraph, a mort-
gage may not involve a principal obligation (incl;uding such initial
service charges, appraisal, inspection, and other fees as the Sec-
retary shall approve) in excess of 98.75 percent of the appraised
value of the property (97.75 percent, in the case of a mortgage with
an apprai value in excess of $50,000), plus the amount of the
mortgage insurance premium paid at the time the mortgage is
insured. For purposes of the preceding sentence, the term ‘appraised
value’ means the amount set forth in the written statement required
under section 226, or a similar amount determined by the Secretary
if section 226 does not apply.”.

SEC. 2103. MORTGAGE INSURANCE PREMIUMS.

(a) PrEmrums.—Section 203(c) of the National Housing Act (12
U.S.C. 1709(c)) is amended—
(1) by inserting “(1)” after “(c)”;
(2) by striking the last sentence; and
(3) by adding at the end the following new aph:

“(2) Notwithstanding any other provision of this section, each
mortgage secured by a 1- to 4-family dwelling and executed on or
after October 1, 1994, that is an obligation of the Mutual Mortgage
Insurance Fund, shall be subject to the following requirements:

_ “(A) The Secretary shall establish and collect, at the time of
insurance, a single premium payment in an amount equal to



104 STAT. 1388-18 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

2.25 percent of the amount of the original insured principal
obligation of the mortgage. Upon payment in full of the prin-
cipal obligation of a mortgage prior to the maturity date of the
mortgage, the Secretary shall refund all of the unearned pre-
miurﬁ charges paid on the mortgage pursuant to this subpara-
graph.

“(B) In addition to the premium under subparagraph (A), the
Secretary shall establish and collect annual premium payments
in an amount equal to 0.50 percent of the remaining insured
principal balance (excluding the portion of the remaining bal-
ance attributable to the premium collected under subparagraph
(A) and without taking into account delinquent payments or
prepayments) for the following periods:

“(i) For any mortgage involving an original principal
obligation (excluding any , premium collected under
subparagraph (A)) that is-less than 90 percent of the ap-
praised value of the property (as of the date the mortgage is
accepted for insurance), for the first 11 years of the mort-
gage term.

.*(ii) For any mortgage invclving an original principal
obligation (excluding any premium collected under
subparagraph (A)) that is greater than or equal to 90 per-
cent of such value, for the first 30 years of the mortgage
term; except that notwithstanding the matter preceding
clause (i), for any mortgage involving an original principal
obligation (excluding any premium collected under
subparagraph (A)) that is greater than 95 percent of such
value, the annual premium collected during the 30-year
period under this clause shall be in an amount equal to 0.55
percent of the remaining insured principal balance (exclud-
ing the portion of the remaining balance attributable to the
premium collected under subparagraph (A) and without
taking into account delinquent payments or prepay-

ments).”.
12 USC 1709 (b) TrRaNsITION PrOVISIONS.—Notwithstanding section 203(c) of the
note. National Housing Act (as amended by subsection (a)), mortgage

insurance premiums on mortgages executed during fiscal years 1991
through 1994 and that are obligations of the Mutual Mortgage
Insurance Fund shall be subject to the following requirements:
(1) 1991 anp 1992.—For mortgages executed during fiscal
yvears 1991 and 1992 (but after the date of the effectiveness of
regulations issued under subsection (c)), the Secretary shall
establish and collect the following premiums:

(A) Up-FrONT.—At the time of insurance, a single pre-
mium payment in an amount equal to 3.80 percent of the
amount of the original insured principal obligation of the
mortgage.

(B) ANNUAL.—In addition to the premium under subpara-
graph (A), annual premium payments in an amount equal
to 0.50 percent of the remaining insured principal balance
(excluding the portion of the remaining balance attrib-
utable to the premium collected under subparagraph (A)
and without taking into account delinquent payments or
prepayments), for any mortgage involving an original prin-
cipal obligation (excluding any premium collected under
subparagraph (A)) that is—



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-19

(i) less than 90 percent of the appraised value of the
property (as of the date the mortgage is accepted for
insurance), for the first 5 years of the mortgage term;

(ii) greater than or equal to 90 percent of such value
but equal to or less than 95 percent of such value, for
the first 8 years of the mortgage term; and

(iii) greater than 95 percent of such value, for the
first 10 years of the mortgage term.

(2) 1993 anp 1994.—For mortgages executed during fiscal
years 1993 and 1994, the Secretary shall establish and collect
the following premiums:

(A) Up-FRONT.—At the time of insurance, a single pre-
mium payment in an amount equal to 3.00 percent of the
amount of the original insured principal obligation of the
mortgage.

(B) ANNUAL.—In addition to the premium under subpara-
graph (A), annual premium payments in an amount equal
to 0.50 percent of the remaining insured principal balance
(excluding the portion of the remaining balance attrib-
utable to the premium collected under subparagraph (A)
and without taking into account delinquent payments or
prepayments), for any mortgage involving an original prin-
cipal obligation (excluding any premium collected under
subparagraph (A)) that is—

(i) less than 90 percent of the appraised value of the
property (as of the date the mortgage is accepted for
insurance), for the first 7 years of the mortgage term;

(ii) greater than or equal to 90 percent of such value
but equal to or less than 95 percent of such value, for
the first 12 years of the mortgage term; and

(i) greafer than 95 percent of such value, for the
first 30 years of the mortgage term.

(3) Rerunps.—With respect to any mortgage subject to pre-
miums under this subsection, the Secretary shall refund all of
the unearned premium charges paid on a mortgage pursuant to
paragraph (1)A) or (2)(A) upon payment in full of the principal
obligation of the mo prior to the maturity date.

(¢) REcuLATIONS.—The retary shall issue regulations to carry 12 USC 1709
out this section and the amendments made by this section not later note.
than the expiration of the 90-day period beginning on the date of the
enactment of this Act.

SEC. 2104. MUTUAL MORTGAGE INSURANCE FUND DISTRIBUTIONS.

Section 205 of the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1711) is
amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:

“(e) In determining whether there is a surplus for distribution to
mortgagors under this section, the Secretary shall take into account
the actuarial status of the entire Fund.”.

SEC. 2105. ACTUARIAL SOUNDNESS OF MUTUAL MORTGAGE INSURANCE
FUND.

Section 205 of the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1711), as
amended by the preceding provisions of this Act, is further amended
by adding at the end the following new subsections:

“(fX1) The Secretary shall ensure that the Mutual Mortgage
Insurance Fund attains a capital ratio of not less than 1.25 percent



104 STAT. 1388-20 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

within 24 months after the date of the enactment of this subsection
and maintains such ratio thereafter, subject to paragraph (2).

“(2) The Secretary shall endeavor to ensure that the Mutual
Mortgage Insurance Fund attains a capital ratio of not less than 2.0
percent within 10 years after the date of the enactment of this
subsection, and s ensure that the Fund maintains at least such

pltal ratio at all times thereafter.

(3) Upon the expiration of the 24-month period beginning on the
date of the enactment of this subsection, the Secre shall submit
to the Congress a report describing the actions the retary will
take to ensure that the Mutual Mortgage Insurance Fund attains
the capital ratio required under paragraph (2).

“(4) For purposes of this subsection:

“(A) The term ‘capital’ means the economic net worth of the
Mutual Mortgzli;ﬁe Insurance Fund, as determined by the Sec-
retary under the annual audit requ1red under section 538.

“(B) The term ‘capital ratio’ means the ratio of capital to
unamortized insurance-in-force.

“(C) The term ‘economic net worth’ means the current cash
available to the Fund, plus the net present value of all future
cash inflows and outflows expected to result from the outstand-
mg mortgages in the Fund.

The term ‘unamortized insurance-in-force’ means the
remammg obligation on outstanding mortgages which are
obligations of the Mutual Mortgage Insurance Fund, as esti-
mated by the Sec!'ei:li::ll;i'I

“(g) The retary s provide for an independent actuarial
study of the Mutual Mortgage Insurance Fund to be conducted
annually and shall report annually to the Congress regarding the
financial status of the Fund.

“th)(1) If, pursuant to the independent annual actuarial study of
the Mutual Mortgage Insurance Fund required under subsection (g),
the Secretary determines that the Mutual Mortgage Insurance Fund
is not meeting the operational goals under paragraph (2), the Sec-
retary may not issue distributions, and may, by regulation, propose
and implement any adjustments to the insurance premiums under
section 203(c) or section 2103(b) of the Omnibus Budget Reconcili-
ation Act of 1990. Upon determining that a ﬂemmm change is
appropriate under the preceding sentence, the Secretary shall
immediately notify Congress of the proposed change and the reasons
for the change. Any such premium change shall not take effect
before the expiration of the 90-day period beginning upon such
notification.

“(2) The operational goals referred to in paragraph (1) shall be—

“(A) maintaining an adequate capital ratio;

“(B) meeting the needs of homebuyers with low
downpayments and first-time homebuyers by providing access
to mortgage credit;

“(C) minimizing ‘the risk to the Fund and to homeowners from
homeowner default; and

“(D) avoiding adverse selection.”.

SEC. 2106. HOME EQUITY CONVERSION MORTGAGE INSURANCE DEM-
ONSTRATION.

(a) TERMINATION DATE.—The first sentence of section 255(g) of the

National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1715z-20(g)) is amended by striking
“September 30, 1991” and inserting ‘‘September 30, 1995



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-21

(b) NumBER OF MORTGAGES INSURED.—Section 255(g) of the Na-
tional Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 17152-20(g)) is amended by striking
the second sentence and inserting the following: “The total number
of mortgages insured under this section may not exceed 25,000.”.

Subtitle C—Auction of Federally Insured
Mortgages

SEC. 2201. AUCTION OF MULTIFAMILY MORTGAGES.

Section 221(g)(4) of the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 17151(gX4))
is amended by adding after subparagraph (B) the following new

Bubparag'ra?h:
“(CXi) In lieu of accepting assignment of the original
credit instrument and the mo securing the credit

instrument under subparagraph (A) in exchange for receipt
of debentures, the Secretary shall arrange for the sale of
the beneficial interests in the mortfsge loan through an
auction and sale of the (I) mortgage loans, or (II) participa-
tion certificates, or other mortgage-backed obligations in a
form acceptable to the Secretary (in this subparagraph
referred to as ‘participation certificates’). The Secretary
shall arrange the auction and sale at a price, to be paid to
the mo , of par plus accrued interest to the date of
sale. The sale price shagl also include the right to a subsidy
payment described in clause (iii).

‘(iiXI) The Secre shall conduct a public auction to
determine the lowest interest rate necessary to accomplish
a sale of the beneficial interests in the original credit
L 4 s A e vevtgage shal]

mo! who e a mortgage
provide the Secretary and persons m at the auction a
description of the characteristics of the original credit
instrument and mortgage securing the original credit in-
strument, which s include the principal mortgage bal-
ance, original stated interest rate, service fees, real estate
and tenant characteristics, the level and duration of ap-
plicable Federal subsidies, and any other information deter-
mined by the Secretary to be appropriate. The Secretary
shall also provide information ing the status of the
Et;operty with respect to the provisions of the Emergency

w Income Housing Preservation Act of 1987 or any subse-
quent Act with to eligibility to prepay the mortgage,
a statement of whether the owner has filed a notice of
intent to prepay or a plan of action under the Emergency
Low Income Housing Preservation Act of 1987 or any subse-
quent Act, and the details with respect to incentives pro-
vided under the Emergency Low Income Housing
Preservation Act of 1987 or any subsequent Act in lieu of
exercising prepayment rights.

‘“(III) The Secretary shall, upon receipt of the information
in subclause (II), promptly advertise for an auction and
publish such mortgage gescn ions in advance of the auc-
::iion'. Tht?: Seé:_re 2 may o(élo uct the auction at any t:cizﬁe

uring the 6-month peri inning upon receipt of the
information in subclause (Hm ul;gderpgo circumsp tances



104 STAT. 1388-22

PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

may the Secretary conduct an auction before 2 months after
receiving the mortgagee’s written notice of intent to assign
its mortgage to the Secreta?.

“IV) In any auction under this subparagraph, the Sec-
retary shall accept the lowest interest rate bid E}r purchase
that the Secretary determines to be acceptable. The Sec-
retary shall cause the accepted bid to be published in the
Federal Register. Settlement for the sale of the credit in-
strument and the mortgage securing the credit instrument
shall occur not later than 30 business days after the date
winning bidders are selected in the auction, unless the
Secretary determines that extraordinary circumstances re-
quire an extension (not to exceed 60 lt-{ays) of the period.

‘“(V) If no bids are received, the bids that are received are
not acceptable to the Secretary, or settlement does not
occur within the period under subclause (IV), the mortgagee
shall retain all rights (including the right to interest, at a
rate to be determined by the Secretary, for the period
covering any actions taken under this subparagraph) under
this section to assign the mortgage loan to the retary.

“(iii) As part of the auction process, the Secretary shall
agree to provide a monthly interest subsidy payment from
the General Insurance Fund to the purchaser under the
auction of the original credit instrument or the mortgage
securing the credit instrument (and any subsequent holders
or assigns who are approved mortgagees). The subsidy pay-
ment shall be paid on the first day of each month in an
amount equal to the difference between the stated interest
due on the mortgage loan and the lowest interest rate
necessary to accomplish a sale of the mortgage loan or
participation certificates (less the servicing fee, if appro-

riate) for the then unpaid principal balance plus accrued

interest at a rate determined by the Secretary. Each in-

terest subsidy payment shall be treated by the holder of the

mortgage as interest paid on the mortgage. The interest

subsidy ent shall be provided until the earlier of—
“(fat{nr:maturity date of the loan;

“(II) prepayment of the mortgage loan in accordance

with the Egn!:ergency Low Income Housing Preservation

Act of 1987 or any subsequent Act, where applicable; or

“(I1I) default and full payment of insurance benefits

on the mortgage loan by the Federal Housing Adminis-

tration.

“(iv) The Secretary shall require that the mortgage loans
or participation certificates presented for assignment are
auctioned as whole loans with servicing rights released and
also are auctioned with servicing rights retained by the
current servicer,

“(v) To the extent practicable, the Secretary shall encour-
age State housing finance agencies, nonprofit organizations,
and organizations representing the tenants of the property
securing the mortgage, or a qualified mortgagee participat-
ing in a plan of action under the Emergency Low Income
Housing Preservation Act of 1987 or subsequent Act to
participate in the auction.

“(vi) The Secretary shall implement the requirements
imposed by this subparagraph within 30 days from the date



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-23

of enactment of this subparagraph and not be subject to the
requirement of prior issuance of regulations in the Federal
Register. The Secretary shall issue regulations implement-
ing this section within 6 months of the enactment of this
subparagraph.

“(vii) Nothing in this subparagraph shall diminish or
impair the low income use restrictions applicable to the
pro_lect under the original regulatory agreement or the

agreement entered into pursuant to the Emergency
I.ow Income Housing Preservation Act of 1987 or subse-
quent Act, if any, or other agreements for the provision of
Federal assistance to the housing or its tenants.

“(viii) This subparagraph shall not apply after Septem-
ber 30, 1995. Not later than January 31 of each year
(beginning in 1992), the Secretary shall submit to the Con-
gress a report including statements of the number of mort-
gages auctioned and sold and their value, the amount of
subsidies committed to the program under this subpara-
graph, the ability of the Secretary to coordinate the pro-
gram with the incentives provided under the Emergency
Low Income Housing Preservation Act of 1987 or subse-
quent Act, and the costs and benefits derived from the
program for the Federal Government.”.

Subtitle D—Crime and Flood Insurance
Programs

SEC. 2301. CRIME INSURANCE PROGRAM.

(a) ExTeENsiION oF GENERAL AutHORITY.—Section 1201(b) of the
National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1749bbb(b)) is amended b{: striking
“September 30, 1991” in the matter preceding paragraph (1) and
inserting “Sept.ember 30, 1995”.

(b) CONTINUATION OF Ens'rmu ConTrACTS.—Section 1201(bX1) of
the National Housing Act (12 U.S.C. 1749bbb(b)(1)) is amended by
striking “September 30, 1992"” and inserting “September 30, 1996”.

(c) EXTENSION OF le'm'non oN PreEmMiumMs.—Section 542(c) of the
Housing and Community Development Act of 1987 (12 U.S.C.
1749bbb-10c note) is amended by striking “September 30, 1991” and
inserting “September 30, 1995”.

SEC. 2302. FLOOD INSURANCE PROGRAM.

(a) ExTENsION oF GENERAL AUTHORITY.—Section 1319 of the Na-
tional Flood Insurance Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 4026) is amended by
striking “September 30, 1991” and inserting ‘‘September 30, 1995”,

(b) EXTENSION oF EMERGENCY PROGRAM.—Section 1336(a) of the
National Flood Insurance Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 4056(a)) is amended
l{gggtnkmg “September 30, 1991” and inserting “September 30,

(c) EXTENSION OF LIMITATION ON PREMIUMS.—Section 541(d) of the
Housing and Community Development Act of 1987 (42 U.S.C. 4015
note) is amended by striking “September 30, 1991” and inserting
“September 30, 1995y

(d) Ex-mns:on or ErosioNn Provisions.—Section 1306(cX7) of the
National Flood Insurance Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 4013(c)7)) is



104 STAT. 1388-24 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

amended by striking “September 30, 1991” and inserting ‘“‘Septem-
ber 30, 1995”.

() INCLUSION oF CosTS IN PREMIUMS.—

(1) EsTIMATES OF PREMIUM RATES.—Section 1307(a) of the
National Flood Insurance Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 4014(a)) is
amended—

(A) in paragraph (1)BXi), by striking “and” at the end;

(B) in paragraph (1)(B)Xii), by inserting '‘and” after the
comma at the end;

(C) in paragraph (1)(B), by inserting at the end the follow-
ing new clause:

“(ili) any remaining administrative expenses in-
curred in carrying out the flood insurance and flood-
plain management programs (including the costs of
mapping activities under section 1360) not included
under clause (ii), which shall be recovered by a fee
charged to policyholders and such fee shall not be
subject to any agents’ commissions, company expense
allowances, or State or local premium taxes,”; and

(D) in paragraph (2), by inserting after “title” the
following: “, and which, together with a fee charged to
policyholders that shall not be not subject to any agents’
commission, company expenses allowances, or State or local
premium taxes, shall include any administrative expenses
incurred in carrying out the flood insurance and floodplain
management programs (including the costs of mapping
activities under section 1360)".

(2) ESTABLISHMENT OF CHARGEABLE PREMIUM RATES.—Section
1308 of the National Flood Insurance Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C.
4015) is amended—

(A) in subsection (b)—

(i) by striking “and” at the end of paragraph (2);

(:iii) by redesignating paragraph (3) as paragraph (4);
an

(iii) by inserting after paragraph (2), the following
new paragraph:

“(3) adequate, together with the fee under paragraph (1)(B)iii)
or (2) of section 1307(a), to provide for any administrative
expenses of the flood insurance and floodplain management
programs (including the costs of mapping activities under sec-
tion 1360), and”’; and

(B) by striking subsection (d) and inserting the following
new subsection:

“(d) With respect to any chargeable premium rate prescribed
under this section, a sum equal to the portion of the rate that covers
any administrative expenses of carrying out the flood insurance and
floodplain management programs which have been estimated under
paragraphs (1}BXii) and (1XBXiii) of section 1307(a) or paragraph (2)
of such section (including the fees under such paragraphs), shall be
paid to the Director. The Director shall deposit the sum in the
National Flood Insurance Fund established under section 1310.”.

(3) NATIONAL FLOOD INSURANCE FUND.—Section 1310(a)4) of
the National Flood Insurance Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 4017(a)4)) is
amended to read as follows:

‘(4) to the extent approved in appropriations Acts, to pay any
administrative expenses of the flood insurance and floodplain



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-25

management programs (including the costs of mapping activi-
ties under section 1360); and”.

(4) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—Section 1375 of the National
Flood Insurance Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 4126) is amended by
striking “program” and all that follows and inserting the fol-
lowing: “and floodplain management programs authorized
under this title may be paid with amounts from the National
Flood Insurance Fund (as provided under section 1310(a)(4)),
subject to approval in appropriations Acts.”.

(5) EXCEPTION TO LIMITATION ON PREMIUM INCREASES.—Not-
withstanding section 541(d) of the Housing and Community
Development Act of 1987 (42 U.S.C. 4015 note) (as amended by
this section), the premium rates charged for flood insurance
under any program established pursuant to the National Flood
Insurance Act of 1968 may be increased by more than 10
percent during fiscal year 1991, except that any increase in such
rates not resulting from the inclusion in chargeable premium
rates of administrative expenses of the flood insurance and
floodplain management programs (pursuant to the amendments
made by this subsection) may not exceed 10 percent.

Subtitle E—Effective Date

SEC. 2401. EFFECTIVE DATE.

If the Cranston-Gonzalez National Affordable Housing Act is
enacted before the enactment of this Act, the provisions of subtitles
B and C (of this title) and the amendments made by such subtitles
shall not take effect. This section shall apply notwithstanding any
prg:'iglio% relgting to effective date or appﬁcabi]jty contained in
subtitle B or C.

TITLE III—STUDENT LOANS AND LABOR
PROVISIONS

Subtitle A—Student Loan Program Savings

SEC. 3001. SHORT TITLE.

This subtitle may be cited as the “Student Loan Default Preven-
tion Initiative Act of 1990".

SEC. 3002. SUPPLEMENTAL PRECLAIMS ASSISTANCE PAYMENTS.

(a) ELIMINATION OF SUPPLEMENTAL PRECLAIMS AsSISTANCE RE-
IMBURSEMENTS.—Section 428(c) of the Higher Education Act of 1965
(20 U.S.C. 1078(c)) is amended—

(1) in the first sentence of paragraph (1)(A), by striking
including the administrative costs of supiplemental preclaim
?g)s(lg)tﬁmce for default prevention as defined in paragraph

(2) in pﬂragraph (6XC)), by striking “this paragraph” and
inserting * mnon 7

(3) in EXCIAXND), by striking “required or permitted
under (2XA) of this subsection and subsection (f)” and
inserting “generally comparable in intensiveness to the level of

42 USC 4015
note.

Student Loan
Default
Prevention
Imt.lative Act of

20 USC 1001
note.



104 STAT. 1388-26 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

20 USC 1078-7
note.

20 USC 1085.

preclaims assistance performed, prior to the 120th day of delin-
quency, by the guaranty agency as of October 16, 1990™;
O b ateaking ot P
y 8 reimbursement”’ and inserting “paymen
under subsection (1)”’; and
(B) by striking “which the guaranty agency is required or
permitted to provide pursuant to paragraph (2)XA) of this
subsection ans subsection (f)” and inserting “described in
(5)dlii‘rigian]:.ml':l ('ixgl)t(l)lf tﬁhirss: ubp:;agra W2 h (6)CXiv)
y e sentence of paragrap. iv).

(b) Fixep PAYMENTS FOR PRECLAIMS ASSISTANCE.—Section 428 of
such Act is further amended by adding at the end thereof the
following new subsection:

“(1) PRECLAIMS ASSISTANCE AND SUPPLEMENTAL PRECLAIMS ASSIST-

“(1) AssisTancE REQUIRED.—Upon receipt of a proper request
from the lender, a guaranty agency having an agreement with
the Secretary under subsection (c) of this section shall engage in
preclaims assistance activities (as described in subsection
(c)6)XC)XiX]) and supplemental preclaims assistance activities
(as described in subsection (cX6)C)) with respect to each loan
covered by such agreement.

“(2) PAYMENTS FOR SUPPLEMENTAL PRECLAIMS ASSISTANCE.—
The Secretary shall make payments in accordance with the
provisions of this aph to any guaranty agency that en-
gages in supplemen preclaims assistance (as defined in
subsection (c}6)C)) on a loan guaranteed under this part. Such
payments shall be equal to $50.00 for each loan on which such
assistance is performed and for which a default claim is not
presented to the guaranty agency by the lender on or before the
150th day after the loan becomes 120 days delinquent.”.

SEC. 3003. INITIAL DISBURSEMENT AND ENDORSEMENT REQUIREMENTS.

(a) AMENDMENT.—Section 428G(b)1) of the Higher Education Act
of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1078-T(b)1)) is amended to read as follows:

“(1) FirsT YEAR STUDENTS.—The first installment of the pro-
ceeds of any loan made, insured, or guaranteed under this part
that is made to a student borrower who is entering the first year
of a program of undergraduate education, and who has not
previously obtained a loan under this part, shall not (regardless
of the amount of such loan or the duration of the period of
enrollment) be presented by the institution to the student for
endorsement until 30 days after the borrower begins a course of
study, but may be delivered to the eligible institution prior to
the end of that 30-day period.”.

(b) ErrFecTive DaTE.—The amendment made by this section shall
be effective for loans made on or after the date of enactment of this
Act to cover the cost of instruction for periods of enrollment begin-
ning on or after January 1, 1991.

SEC. 3004. INELIGIBILITY BASED ON HIGH DEFAULT RATES.

(a) INn GENErRAL.—Section 435(a) of the Higher Education Act of
1965 (20 U.S.C. 1088(a)) is amended by adding at the end thereof the
fo]lowing new paragraph:

“(3) INELIGIBILITY BASED ON HIGH DEFAULT RATES.—(A) An
institution whose cohort default rate is equal to or greater than
the threshold percentage specified in subparagraph (B) for each



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-27

of the three most recent fiscal years for which data are avail-
able shall not be eligible to participate in a program under this
part for the fiscal year for which the determination is made and
for the two succeeding fiscal years, unless, within 30 days of
receiving notification from the Secretary of the loss of eligibility
underu:ﬁis paragraph, the institution appeals the loss of its
eligibility to the Secretary. The Secretary shall issue a decision
on any such appeal within 45 days after its submission. Such
decision may permit the institution to continue to participate in
a program under this part if—

“(i) the institution demonstrates to the satisfaction of the
Secretary that the Secretary’s calculation of its cohort de-
fault rate is not accurate, and that recalculation would
reduce its cohort default rate for any of the three fiscal
years below the threshold percentage specified in subpara-
graph (B); or

“(ii) there are, in the judgment of the Secretary, excep-
tional mitigating circumstances that would make the
application of this paragraph inequitable.

During such appeal, the Secretary may permit the institution to
continue to participate in a program under this part.

“(B) For purposes of determinations under subparagraph (A),
the threshold percentage is—

“(i) 35 percent for fiscal year 1991 and 1992; and

“(ii) 30 percent for any succeeding fiscal year.

“(C) Until July 1, 1994, this paragraph shall not apply to any
institution that 1s—

‘(i) a part B institution within the meaning of section
322(2) of this Act;

“(ii) a tribally controlled community college within the
meaning of section 2(aX4) of the Tribally Controlled
Community College Assistance Act of 1978; or

“(iii) a Navajo Community College under the Navajo
Community Cozl’fege Act.”.

(b) REFusaL TO ProviDE StATEMENT TO LENDER.—Section
428(a)(2)(F) of such Act (20 U.S.C. 1078(a)}2)F)) is amended by insert-
ing before the period at the end thereof the following: “, except that,
in individual cases where the institution determines that the por-
tion of the student’s expenses to be covered by the loan can be met
more appropriately, either by the institution or directly by the
student, from other sources, the institution may refuse to provide
such statement or may reduce the determination of need contained
in such statement”.

(c) ExTEnsioN orF DeFAuLT RATE LimrraTions oN SLS LoaNns.—
Section 2003(a)3) of the Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act of 1989 20 USC 1078-1
is amended— nofe.

4 (”1) byd inserting “paragraph (1) of”’ after “amendments made
y'; an
19&)2é”by striking out “October 1, 1991” and inserting “October 1,

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by this section shall 20 USC 1085
be effective July 1, 1991, except that the amendment made by D"ote-
subsection (b) shall be effective upon enactment.

SEC. 3005. ABILITY TO BENEFIT,

(a) In GENERAL.—Section 484(d) of the Higher Education Act of
1965 (20 U.S.C. 1091(d)) is amended to read as follows:



104 STAT. 1388-28 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

20 USC 1088
note.

20 USC 1078-1
note.

11 USC 362 note.

“(d) ApLiTY To BENEFIT.—In order for a student who is admitted
on the basis of ability to benefit from the education or training
offered to be eligible for any grant, loan, or work assistance under
this title, the student shall, prior to enrollment, pass an independ-
ently administered examination approved by the Secretary.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT. ion 481(b) of the Higher Edu-
cation Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1088(b)) is amended in the fourth
sentence by inserting “, except in accordance with section 484(d) of
this Act,” after “shall not”.

(c) ErreEcTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by this section shall
apply to any grant, loan, or work assistance to cover the cost of
instliu(itéigizl for periods of enrollment beginning on or after Janu-
ary 1, !

SEC. 3006. MAXIMUM SLS LOAN AMOUNTS.

(a) ErrecTIVE DATE EXTENSION.—Section 2003(b)X2) of the Omnibus
Budget Reconciliation Act of 1989 is amended by striking “1991"
and inserting “1996".

(b) PERIOD FOR DETERMINATION OF MAXIMUM LOAN AMOUNTS.—
Section 428A(b)1) of the Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C.
1078-1(b)) is amended by striking “9 consecutive” and inserting “T
consecutive”.

SEC. 3007. AMENDMENTS TO BANKRUPTCY LAWS.

(a) AuToMATIC STAY AND PROPERTY OF THE ESTATE.—(1) Section
362(b) of title 11, United States Code, is amended—

(A) in paragragh (12), by striking “or” at the end thereof;

(B) in paragraph (13), by striking the period at the end thereof
and inserting a semicolon; and

(C) by inserting immediately following paragraph (13) the
following new paragraphs:

“(14) under subsection (a) of this section, of any action by an
accrediting agency regarding the accreditation status of the
debtor as an educational institution;

“(15) under subsection (a) of this section, of any action by a
State licensing body regarding the licensure of the debtor as an
educational institution; or

“(16) under subsection (a) of this section, of any action by a

anty agency, as defined in section 435(j) of the ngl":er
Etli?xrcation Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1001 et seq.) or the Secretary of
Education regarding the eligibility of the debtor to participate
in programs authorized under such Act.”.

(2) S&c*)tion 541(b) of htitélle;_ 1;, United States Codts;; is a(:inzﬁd:go?

in paragrap , by strik.i::g “or” at the en ereof;,

(B) in paragraph (2), by stri.king riod at the end thereof
and inserting a semicolon and “or”’; an

(C) by adding at the end thereof the following new paragraph:

“3) any eligibility of the debtor to participate in gro%'}'ams
authorized under the Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C.
1001 et seq.; 42 U.S.C. 2751 et seq.), or any accreditation status
or State licensure of the debtor as an educational institution.”.

(3) The amendments made by this subsection shall be effective
upon date of enactment of this Act.

(b) TreaTMENT OF CERTAIN EpucaTiON LOANS IN BANKRUPTCY
ProceeEpinGs.—(1) Section 1328(a)2) of title 11, United States Code,
is amended by striking “‘section 523(a)(5)"’ and inserting “paragraph
(5) or (8) of section 523(a)”.



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-29

(2) The amendment made by paragraph (1) shall not apply to any 11 USC 1328
case under the provisions of title 11, United States Code, commenced note.
before the date of the enactment of this Act.

SEC. 3008. SUNSET PROVISION. 11 USC 362 note.

The amendments made by this subtitle shall cease be effective on
October 1, 1996.

Subtitle B—Labor Related Penalties

SEC. 3101. OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH.

Section 17 of the Occupational Safety and Health Act of 1970 (29
U.8.C. 666) is amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by striking “$10,000 for each violation”
and inserting “$70,000 for each violation, but not less than
$5,000 for each willful violation; * and

(2) in subsections (b), (¢), (d), and (i), by striking “$1,000” and
inserting “$7,000”.

SEC. 3102. MINE SAFETY AND HEALTH.

Section 110 of the Federal Mine Safety and Health Act of 1977 (Sb
U.S.C. 820) is amended—
(1) in subsection (a), by striking “$10,000” and inserting
u$52{;,000n; and
(2) in subsection (b), by striking “1,000” and inserting
“$5,000”, and 2

SEC. 3103. FAIR LABOR STANDARDS.

Section 16(e) of the Fair Labor Standards Act of 1938 (29 U.S.C.
216(e)) is amended—

(1) in the first sentence—

(A) by striking ‘“‘or any person who repeatedly or willfully
violates section 6 or 7”’; and

(B) by striking “not to exceed $1,000 for each such viola-
tion” and inserting “not to exceed $10,000 for each em-
ployee who was the subject of such a violation’’;

(2) by inserting after the first sentence the following: “Any
person who repeatedly or willfully violates section 6 or 7 shall
be subject to a civil penalty of not to exceed $1,000 for each such
violation.”,

(3) by striking “such penalty” each place the term appears
except after “appropriateness of’ and inserting “any penalty
under this subsection”, and

(4) in the last sentence, by striking “Sums” and inserting
“Except for civil penalties collected for violations of section 12,
sums’’; and

(5) by inserting at the end the following new sentence: “Civil
penalties collected for violations of section 12 shall be deposited
in the general fund of the Treasury.”.

" 180 in original. Probably should be “violation";”.
% 80 in original. The “, and” probably should be a period.



104 STAT. 1388-30

PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

TITLE IV—-MEDICARE, MEDICAID, AND
OTHER HEALTH-RELATED PROGRAMS

Subtitle A—Medicare

SEC. 4000. REFERENCES IN SUBTITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) AMENDMENTS TO THE SocIAL SECURITY AcT.—Except as other-
wise specifically provided, whenever in this title an amendment is
expressed in terms of an amendment to or repeal of a section or
other provision, the reference shall be considered to be made to that
section or other provision of the Social Security Act.

(b) TaBLE oF ConTENTS.—The table of contents of this subtitle is as

follows:

Sec. 4000.

FERELLLE

£ BEF FEERELERLLLERLY

4001,
4002.
4003.
4004,
4005. PPS-exe
4006,
4007,
4008,

References in subtitle; table of contents.
Part 1—Provisions RELATING 10 PArT A

Payments for capital-related costs of inpatient hospital services.
Prospective pagment hospitals.

Expansion of DRG payment window.

Payments for medical education costs.

mpt hospitals.

Hospice benefit extension.

Freeze in payments under part A through December 31.
Miscellaneous and technical provisions relating to part A.

Part 2—ProvisionNs RELATING To PArT B
Subpart A—Payment for Physicians’ Services

. Certain overvalued procedures.
. Radiology semcee
Anesthesia se

. Physician pat.bology services.

. Update for physicians’ services.

. New physicians and other new health care practitioners.
. Assistants at surgery.

. Technical components of certain diagnostic tests.

. Interpretation of electrocardiograms.

. Reciprocal billing arrangements.

_v of prepayment medical review screens.
pg;slcmns advisory council.

; Stud of aggregation rule for claims for similar physicians’ services.
: Uhlliat.lon screens for physician visits in rehab itation hospitals.
. Study of regional variations in impact of medicare physician payment

orm.
. Limitation on beneficiary liability.

. Statewide fee schedule areas for physicians’ services.
. Technical corrections.

Subpart B—Other Items and Services

. Payments for hospital outpatient services.

. Durable medical equipment.

. Provisions relating to orthotics and prosthetics.
= Ch.mml dL:‘gnoshc laboratory tests.

ractlt.mners in rural areas

! Goverage of injectal le drugs for treatment of mteoporos
g Separabe payment. under part B for services of certain health practition-

. Reductmn in payments under part B during final 2 months of 1990.
. Payments for medical education costs.
. Certified registered nurse anesthetists.



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-31

4161. Community health centers and rural health clinics.

4162. Partial hospitalization in community mental health centers.
4163. Coverage oF screening mammogmphy

4164. Miscellaneous and technical provisions relating to part B.

Part 3—ProvisioNs RELATING T0 PARrTs A AnD B

4201. Provisions relating to end stage renal disease.

4202. Staff-assisted home dialysis demonstration project.

4203. Extension of secondary payor provisions.

4204. Health maintenance organizations.

4205. Peer review organizations.

4206. Medicare provider agreements assuring the implementation of a patient’s
right to participate in and direct health care decisions affecting the pa-
tient.

4207. Miscellaneous and technical provisions relating to parts A and B.

PaRrT 4—Provisions ReLaTiNG 170 ParT B PrEMIUM AND DEDUCTIBLE

4301. Part B premium.
4302. Part B deductible.

Parr 5—MEDICARE SUPPLEMENTAL INSURANCE PoLICIES

4351. Simplification of medicare supplemental policies.

4352. Guaranteed renewability.

4353. Enforcement of standards.

4354. Preventing duplication.

4355. Loss ratios and refund of p

4356. C]artlficatwn of treatment of plans oﬂ'amd by health maintenance organi-
zations.

4357. Pre-existing condition limitations and limitation on medical underwrit-

4358. Mgmare select policies.

4359. Health insurance advisory services for medicare beneficiaries.
4360. Health insurance information, counseling, and assistance grants.
4361. Medicare and medigap information by telephone.

PART 1—PROVISIONS RELATING TO PART A

SEC. 4001. PAYMENTS FOR CAPITAL-RELATED COSTS OF INPATIENT
HOSPITAL SERVICES.

(a) REpuctioN IN PAavyMENTs For FiscAL Year 1991.—Section
1886(g)(3)AXv) (42 U.S.C. 1395wwi(g)3)AXv)) is amended by striking
“September 30, 1990" and inserting ‘“‘September 30, 1991".

(b) IMPLEMENTATION OF PROSPECTIVE PAYMENT FOR CAPITAL-
Revatep Costs.—Section 1886(g)1XA) (42 U.S.C. 1395ww(g)1)) is
amended by adding at the end the following: “Aggregate payments
made under subsection (d) and this subsection during fiscal years
1992 through 1995 shall be reduced in a manner that results in a
reduction (as estimated by the Secretary) in the amount of such
payments equal to a 10 percent reduction in the amount of pay-
ments attributable to capital-related costs that would otherwise
have been made during such fiscal year had the amount of such
i)g%'ine)l)lts been based on reasonable costs (as defined in section

(w)).".

(c) ExempTiON FOR RURAL PR]'MARY Care HospiTALs.—Section
1886{3](3)(B) is amended by striking “subsection (d)(5)D)iii)).” and
inserting “‘subsection (d)56)D)iii) or a rural primary care hospital
(as defined in section 1861(mm)1)).”

SEC. 4002. PROSPECTIVE PAYMENT HOSPITALS.

(a) CHANGES IN UPDATE FACTORS.— .
(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 1886(b)3)XBXi) (42 TU.S.C.
1395ww(b)(3)(B)(i)) is amended—
(A) by striking “and” at the end of subclause (V);

EEEE & FEEEEE 4% f gEyREY  AeHd



104 STAT. 1388-32 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

42 USC 1395ww

note

(B) in subclause (VI)—
(i) by striking “1991” and inserting “1994”, and
(tili) by redesignating such subclause as subclause (IX);
an
(C) by inserting after subclause (V) the following new
subclauses:
“(VI) for fiscal year 1991, the market basket percentage in-
crease minus 2.0 percentage points for hospitals in all areas,
‘“(VII) for fiscal year 1992, the market basket percentage
increase minus 1.6 percentage points for hospitals in all areas,
“(VIID) for fiscal year 1993, the market basket percentage
mc(;-sase minus 1.55 percentage point for hospitals in all areas,
and”.
(2) ErFecTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by paragraph (1)
shall apply to payments for discharges occurring on or after
January 1, 1991.

(b) CHANGES IN DISPROPORTIONATE SHARE PAYMENTS.—

(1) INCREASE FOR URBAN HOSPITALS WITH MORE THAN 100
BEDs.—Section 1886(d)(5)F)(vii) (42 U.S.C. 1395ww(d)5)F)(vii) is
amended—

(A) in subclause (I), by striking “greater than 20.2,” and
g(l]lzthat follows and inserting the following: “greater than

“(a) for discharges occurring on or after April 1, 1990, and
on or before December 31, 1990, (P-20.2)(.65) + 5.62,

“(b) for discharges occurring on or after January 1, 1991,
and on or before September 30, 1993, (P-20.2)X.7) + 5.62,

“(c) for discharges occurring on or after October 1, 1993,
and on or before September 30, 1994, (P-20.2)(.8) + 5.88, and

“(d) for discharges occurring on or after October 1, 1994,
(P-20.2)(.825) + 5.88; or”’; and

(B) in subclause (II), by striking “hospital, (P-15).6)
+ 2.5,” and inserting the following: “hospital—

“(a) for discharges occurring on or after April 1, 1990, and
on or before December 31, 1990, (P-15).6) + 2.5,

“(b) for discharges occurring on or after January 1, 1991,
and on or before September 30, 1993, (P-15).6) + 2.5,

“(c) for discharges occurring on or after October 1, 1993,
(P-15).65) + 2.5,”.

(2) INCREASE FOR HOSPITALS WITH DISPROPORTIONATE INDIGENT
CARE REVENUES.—Section  1886(d)5)F)iii)) (42 U.S.C.
1395wwi(d)(5)(F)(iii)) is amended by striking “30 percent” and
inserting ‘35 percent”.

(3) REPEAL OF SUNSET.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—Section 1886(d) (42 U.S.C. 1395ww(d)) is
amended by striking “and before October 1, 1995,” each
%:;51)5(1%?( ) )it appears in paragraph (2)(C)iv) and paragraph

i).

(B) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—(A) Section
1886(d)5)BXii) (42 U.S.C. 1395ww(d)(5)B)) is amended to
read as follows:

“(ii) For purposes of clause (iXI), the indirect teaching adjust-
ment factor for discharges occurring on or after May 1, 1986, is
equal to 1.89 X (((1 + r) to the nth power) — 1), where ‘r’ is the
ratio of the hospital’s full-time equivalent interns and residents
to beds and ‘n’ equals .405.”.



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-383

(B) Section 1886(d)3)C)ii) (42 U.S.C. 1395ww(d)X3)XC)Xii) is
amended by striking “occurring—" and all that follows and
inserting the following: “occurring on or after October 1,
1986, of an amount ecfiual to the estl.mah - )(tﬁgl ﬁucﬁoulid mhathe

ent amounts under agra t wo! ve
%yl.?llted from the enactmpeig. of ‘Igne amendments made by
section 9104 of the Medicare and Medicaid Budget Rec-
onciliation Amendments of 1985 and by section 4003(a)(1) of
the Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act of 1987 if the factor
described in clause (ii)(II) of paragraph (5)(B) (determined
without regard to amendments made by the Omnibus
Budget Reconciliation Act of 1990) were applied for dis-
charges occurring on or after such date i of the factor
described in clause (ii) of that paragraph.”

{4) NO RESTANDARDIZING FOR RECENT ADJUSTMEN‘I‘S —

(A) ADJUSTMENTS UNDER OBRA  1989.—Section
1886(d)2XC)Xiv) (42 U.8.C. 1395ww(d)(2XCXiv)) is amended by
striking the period at the end and inserting the
following: “, except that the Secretary shall not exclude
additional payments under such paragraph made as a
result of the enactment of section 6003(c) of the Omnibus
Budget Reconciliation Act of 1989.”.

(B) ADJUSTMENTS UNDER OBRA  1990.—Section
1886(dX2XC)(iv), as amended by subparagraph (A), is further
amended by striking “1989.” and inserting “1989 or the
enactment of section 4002(b) of the Omnibus Budget Rec-
onciliation Act of 1990.”.

(5) ErFecTIvE DATE.—The amendments made by paragraphs 42 USC 1395ww
(1), (3), and (4)(B) shall apply to discharges occurring on or after Dot
January 1, 1991, the amendment made by paragraph (2) shall
apply to dlscharges occurring on or after October 1, 1991, and
the amendment made by paragraph (4)(A) shall take 'effect as if
included in the enactment of the Omnibus Budget Reconcili-
ation Act of 1989.

(c) PaAymENTS TO RURAL HoOSPITALS. —

(1) PHASE-OUT OF SEPARATE AVERAGE STANDARDIZED
AMOUNTS.—Section 1886(b)3)XB)(i) (42 U.S.C. 1395ww(b)3)XBXi),
as amended by subsection (a)(1), is further amended—

(A) in subclause (VI), by striking “in all areas,” and
inserting “in a large urban or other urban area, and the
market basket increase minus 0.7 percentage
point for hospi in a rural area,”;

(B) in subclause (VID, by striking “in all areas,” and
inserting “in a large urban or other urban area, and the
market basket percentage increase minus 0.6 percentage
point for hoefltals located in a rural area,”;

(C) in subclause (VIII), by striking “in all areas, and” and
inserting “in a large urban or other urban area, and the
market basket percentage increase minus (.55 for hospitals
located in a rural area,”’;

(D) in subclause (IX)—

(i) by striking “1994” and inserting “1996”, and
((iii) by redesignating such subclause as subclause (XI);
an

(E) by inserting after subclause (VIII) the following new
subclauses:



104 STAT. 1388-34 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

“(IX) for fiscal year 1994, the market basket percentage in-
crease for hospitals located in a large urban or other urban
area, and the market basket percentage increase plus 1.5

rcentage tpomts for hospitals located in a rural area,

“(X) for fiscal year 1995, the market basket percentage in-
crease for hospitals located in a urban or other urban
area, and such percentage increase for hospitals located in a
rural area as will provide for the average standardized amount
determined under subsection (dX3)(A) for hospitals located in a
rural area being equal to such average standardized amount for
hospitals located in an urban area (other than a large urban
area), and”.

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—(A) Section 1886(b)3)B) (42
OB i clause (D, by striking “(A) and (B),” and insert

in clause (ii), by s “(A) an ,” and inserting
N s s (CXii) and (DX, by striking “(BX0)

in sul paragrap ii) an n, “(BXi)”
each place it ap, inse ’Y

(B) Section 1886(&) (42 U S.C. 1395ww(d)) i 13 amended-—

(i) in paragraph (1)(A)iii), by smkmﬁa:;ural large urban,
or other urban area” and inserting * e urban or other

(ii) in paragraph (3XA)—
(D) in clause (ii), by strikj:? “the Secretary” and
tu}ilsertmg “and ending on or before September 30, 1994,
e Secre
(ID) by ealgxmtmg clause (iii) as clause (v), and
l(III) by inserting after clause (ii) the following new
clauses:

“(iii) For discharges occurring in the fiscal year beginni
October 1, 1994, the average standardized amount for hoarpllgtals
locatedmaruralareashallbeequaltotheaveragestandard
ized amount for hospitals located in an other urban area.

“(iv) For disc es occurring in a fiscal year beginning on or
after October 1, 1995, the Secretary shall compute an average
standardized amount for hospitals located in a e urban area
and for hospitals located in other areas within the United States
and within each region equal to the respective average
standardized amount computed for the previous fiscal year
under this subparagrap b;r e applicable percentage
increase under subsection (b)3)(B)i) with respect to hospitals
located in the respective areas for the fiscal year involved.”;

(iii) in aph (3)(B), by striking “for hospitals -located
ifnnan ur B are?" and all that'::hfol]ows and in?ertmg the
ollowing: “by a factor equal to the proportion of payments
under this subsection (as estimated Ey the Secreuu:iy) based
on DRG prospective payment amounts which are additional
payments described in paragraph (5)A) (relating to outlier
pa(yn;ents) ”tzﬁra h 3)XD)i
iv) in par p 1)—
matter preceding subclause (I), by strikin
“an urban area (or," and all that follows throug
“area),” and inserting “a large urban area”, and
(ID in subclause (1), by stnk.mg an urban area” and
inserting “a urban area
(v) in paragraph (3)DXii), by atnking “a rural area” each
place it appears and inserting “other areas”; and



PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990 104 STAT. 1388-35

(vi) in paragraph (8)(D)—

(I) in the first sentence, by striking “for hospitals
located in an urban area”, and
(IT) by striking the second sentence.

(3) EFFecTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by paragraph (1) 42 USC 1395ww
and paragraph (2)A) shall apply to payments for discharges note.
occurring on or after January 1, 1991, and the amendments
made by paragraph (2)(B) shall take effect October 1, 1994.

(d) AREA WAGE INDEX.—

(1) DETERMINATION OF AREA WAGE INDEX.—(A) For purposes of 4E£SC 1395ww
section 1886(dX3XE) of the Social Security Act for discharges "%
occurring on or after January 1, 1991, and before October 1,
1993, the Secretary of Health and Human Services shall apply
an area wage index determined using the survey of the 1988
wages and wage-related costs of hospitals in the United States
conducted under such section.

(B) The Secretary shall apply the wage index described in
subparagraph (A) without regard to a previous survey of wages
and wage-related costs.

(2) STUDY OF AREA WAGE INDEX ADJUSTMENTS BASED ON PROFES-
SIONAL OCCUPATIONAL COMPONENT.—

(A) Srtupy.—The Prospective Payment Assessment
Commission shall examine available data from States and
other sources measuring earnings and paid hours of
employment of hospital workers by occupational category,
and shall include in such examination an analysis of the
impact of variation in occupational mix on the computation
of the area wage index determined under section
1886(dX3)XE) of the Social Security Act.

(B) ReporT TO conGrEss.—In its March 1991 report, the
Commission shall include recommendations regarding the
feasibility and desirability of modifying such area wage
index to take into account occupational mix, including
variations in occupational mix resulting from differences in
State codes and requirements.

(e) ExTeENnsION oF REGIONAL FLOOR ON STANDARDIZED AMOUNTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 1886(d)X1)(A)iii) (42 TUS.C.
1395ww(d)(1)(A)(m}) is amended by striking “beglnnmg on or
after” and all that follows through “1990” and inserting “begin-
%Isg,?n or after April 1, 1988, and ending on September 30,

(2) STupy.—(A) The Secretary of Health and Human Services 42 USC 1395ww
shall collect sufficient data on the input prices associated with note-
the non-wage-related portion of the adjusted average standard-
ized amounts established under section 1886(d)(3) of the Social
Security Act to identify the extent to which variations in such
amounts among hospitals located in different geographic areas
are attributable to differences in such prices.

(B) Not later than June 1, 1993, the Secretary shall submit a
report to Congress anal such data and shall include in
such report recommenci:tlons regarding a methodology for
adjusting such average standardized amounts to reflect such
variations.

(C) The provisions of chapter 35 of title 44, United States
Code, shall not apply to data collected by the Secretary under
subparagraph (A).



104 STAT. 1388-36 PUBLIC LAW 101-508—NOV. 5, 1990

42 USC 1395ww
note.

42 USC 1395x
note.
42 USC 1395x
note.

(4) EFFecTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by paragraph (1)
shall apply to discharges occurring on or after October 1, 1990.

(f) ELimiNATION OoF HosPiTAL OFF-SET FOR SERVICES OF PHYSICIAN
ASSISTANTS.—

(1) IN cENErRAL.—Section 9338 of the Omnibus Budget Rec-
onciliation Act of 1986 is amended by striking subsection (d).

(2) ErFecTiVE DATE.—The amendment made by paragraph (1)
shall take effect as if included in the enactment of the Omnibus
Budget Reconciliation Act of 1986.

(g) REsPONSIBILITIES AND REPORTING REQUIREMENTS OF PROSPEC-
TIVE PAYMENT ASSESSMENT COMMISSION.—

(1) EXPANSION OF RESPONSIBILTIES 3.—Section 1886(e)(2) (42
U.S.C. 1395ww(e)2)) is amended—-

(A) by striking “(2)"" and inserting “(2XA)"; and

(B) by adding at the end the following new subpara-
graphs: ;

“(B) In order to promote the efficient and effective delivery of
high-quality health care services, the Commission shall, in addition
to carrying out its functions under subparagraph (A), study and
make recommendations for each fiscal year regarding changes in
each existing reimbursement policy under this title under which
payments to an institution are based upon prospectively determined
rates and the development of new institutional reimbursement poli-
cies under this title, including recommendations relating to pay-
ments during such fiscal year under the prospective payment
system established under 